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The Barcode of Life –  
Do We Really Understand What It Is and 

What Someone Plans To Do With It? 
 

Until Covid-19 came along I used to think that the 9/11 attacks were the biggest crime of 
history, and I am referring to the many thread-links that confirmed there were many 
reasons, culprits and multiple agendas wrapped up in the larger crime that was 
committed on 9/11.  In my recent article “The Chino-Americana Virus Plot Revealed 
– Part 2” I noted the missing Brady Bonds that were in the vaults of the WTC that were 
to mature on 9/12/2001, the day after the $240-billion of Brady Bonds went up in dust. 
 
In an earlier article that I reposted on August 21, 2021, “666/999 5G, the Mark of the 
Beast, and the UPC Code, Chapter 15”, I offered a list of known reasons for the Covid-
19 distraction event.  As time distances our memories, those behind Covid-19 are 
counting on time to blur the issue of anyone getting to the bottom of the crimes against 
humanity.  In my way of dealing with the passing of time in retirement, I read scientific 
and medical abstracts, papers written by researchers in the field of microbiology, 
genetics, DNA, biomedicine, and biochemistry.  I can tell you there are many brilliant 
minds around the world who are determined to become the next Nobel Laureate and 
the advances being made are very promising that an answer for Covid-19 will become 
known sooner than some would want it to be known.   
  

From my extensive reading, I follow the findings and papers of highly qualified 
scientists, there is ample reason why you should resist to the dying breath any jab in the 
shoulder or any so-called PCR test to see if you have Covid, being used as an excuse 
to poison you with an alleged Vaxx.  The Virus was created for the Vaxx, it is as simple 
as that but it really speaks to the global experiment in which every human being on the 
planet is the “lab rat” or “ferret”.  By that statement I am saying the Vaxx was patented 
up to ten years before the virus was supposed to have been released.  Most of this will 
simply seem like something that you would read in a sci-fi novel.  It seems to be more 
likely it is the “back to the future” element of Satan’s New World Order.   
 
Clif High recently has said that Covid was not to be released until around 2025, and that 
the world elite intended it be released following a war between China and the U.S.  Clif 
High sees the elite as not being really very smart in their planning for contingencies and 
unplanned screw ups.  Clif High is more optimistic than I am about when it comes to the 
outcome of what lies ahead.  Clif and I differ in that I hold to a Biblical world view 
scenario where God intervenes in the chaos.  Clif is not a Christian, but that does not 
mean his data-sets are not informative insights to the near-future outcome.   
 
I do not believe we should rule out a war between China and the U.S.  J.R. Nyquist is a 
decades long expert on China and Russia and just a few days ago he did an interview 
that ran an hour-and-a-half long.  We know from Dr. Richard M. Flemming’s new book, 
‘Is Covid-19 a Bioweapon’ that it is indeed a Bioweapon and China was very much 

http://pastorbobreid.com/PDFs/66615.pdf
http://pastorbobreid.com/PDFs/66615.pdf
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involved in its release.  Without a doubt there is a deeper picture emerging of how evil 
the plan is when it comes to understanding DNA and the human body.  It is here where 
my focus will be directed toward providing background understanding is centered in this 
article.  I am suggesting there is a much larger issue at stake in understanding of Covid-
19.  This is a Satanic mingling the seed of humanity with the demonic! 

 

 

Boldly displayed on the International Barcode of Life (“IBOL”) website is the catchy 
phrase “illuminate biodiversity to save our living planet.”  Its stated vision is “to illuminate 
biodiversity changing the way humanity understands our planet.”  It explains further, 
“illuminate biodiversity by developing globally accessible, DNA-based systems for the 
discovery and identification of all multicellular life.”  It’s not clear what the words actually 
mean and they seem harmless enough, a little theatrical perhaps but harmless. So, 
what do they mean and have any of us asked what IBOL is really about? 
 
Celeste Solum, a former FEMA operative, has done extensive research into IBOL, how 
it fits into the bigger picture and what it means for us and our world.  During an interview 
she gave an overview of her research into IBOL which you can watch HERE.  Below is 
a brief outline of that interview and references listed under “further reading” are 
documents or websites Solum recommends as a starting point for those wanting to 
research this topic further.  It gets darker as you deep dive the WEF web site. 
 
At the time of her interview the World Economic Forum (“WEF”) was having their 
Pioneers of Change Summit which is relevant as it demonstrates how an overarching 
plan is unfolding.  In fact, anyone going to the WEF web site is blown away with the 
many levels of the New World Order Plan.  The WEF web site confirms this has been in 
the works for years, perhaps decades. 
 

https://www.usa.gov/federal-agencies/federal-emergency-management-agency
https://davidicke.com/2020/11/20/former-fema-operative-celeste-solum-talks-with-david-icke-the-covid-tests-are-magnetically-tagging-you-and-the-vaccine-is-designed-for-mass-depopulation-and-the-synthetic-transformation-of-the-huma/
https://www.weforum.org/agenda/2020/11/pioneers-of-change-summit-everything-you-need-to-know/
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Celeste Solum begins her interview with this statement, “Anyone who has taken a Covid 
test – they have placed a magnetic beacon – you have been tagged, you have been 
barcoded.  And, I am going to provide you with evidence of that today – in their own 
words, from various sources.” “They’ve been working on this plan for a long time”, 
Solum said. 
 
Firstly, are the three Asilomar Conferences. 
  
Asilomar is an ex-military facility in California, USA and is now a conference site.  The 
conferences are named after the facility where they were held. 
 
In the first Asilomar Conference. In the early 1970s scientists were only just learning 
how to manipulate DNA from various sources into combinations that were not known to 
exist naturally. Scientists who were concerned about this new line of experimentation 
called for a worldwide moratorium on the work, followed by an international conference 
of experts at which the nature and magnitude of the risks could be assessed.  The 
conference, held in 1975, became known as The Asilomar Conference on Recombinant 
DNA.  It was agreed that the research should continue but under stringent guidelines. 
 
Further reading: 
140 Scientists Ask: Now that We Can Rewrite the Genetic Code, What Are We Going to 
Say? 
Asilomar and Recombinant DNA: The End of the Beginning 
 
The second Asilomar Conference. In 2010, The Asilomar International Conference on 
Climate Intervention Technologies, was held where 200 scientists gathered in an 
attempt to determine how research into geoengineering should proceed. What emerged 
from the conference were some unexpected lessons about the possibilities and pitfalls 
of manipulating the earth’s climate to offset global warming. 
 
The third Asilomar Conference. In 2017, The Asilomar Conference on Beneficial AI, 
brought more than 100 thought leaders and researchers in economics, law, ethics, and 
philosophy together to address and formulate principles of beneficial AI. Its outcome 
was the creation of a set of guidelines for AI research – the 23 Asilomar AI Principles. 
 
Secondly, there is IBOL 
IBOL is a Rockefeller initiative which aims to barcode and tag all life.  The Rockefeller 
University describes The Barcode of Life as “a short DNA sequence, from a uniform 
locality on the genome, used for identifying species;” and, DNA barcoding as “an 
emerging global standard for identifying species.” 
 
The Consortium for the Barcode of Life (“CBOL”) is an international initiative devoted to 
developing DNA barcoding as a global standard for the identification of biological 
species. CBOL has more than 29,000 users, and 130 member organizations from more 
than 200 countries.  It has on file 720,869 Barcode Index Numbers Species Proxies. 
 

https://www.opinyuns.com/post/david-icke-interviews-celeste-solum-re-covid-tests
https://www.nature.com/articles/455290a/
https://people.reed.edu/~mab/classes/phil318/RollingStone%20Asilomar.pdf
https://people.reed.edu/~mab/classes/phil318/RollingStone%20Asilomar.pdf
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/books/NBK234217/?report=classic
https://www.wired.com/2010/03/geoengineering-asilomar/
https://e360.yale.edu/features/a_hard_look_at_the_perils_and_potential_of_geoengineering
https://futureoflife.org/ai-principles/
https://www.techrepublic.com/article/23-principals-for-beneficial-ai-tech-leaders-establish-new-guidelines/
https://phe.rockefeller.edu/barcode/
https://phe.rockefeller.edu/barcode/
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The Barcode of Life Data System is designed to support the generation and application 
of DNA barcode data. It is part of IBOL goal to tag and identify all life forms.  It currently 
has on file 9,454,552 DNA Barcodes in its library.   
 
Further reading: 
International Barcode of Life 
Consortium for the Barcode of Life 
Barcode of Life Data System 
DNA Barcoding 
 
They are changing the practice and science of taxonomy.  Taxonomy is the science of 
naming, describing and classifying organisms and includes all plants, animals and 
microorganisms of the world.  
 
Since ancient times, life on earth was classified by the Linnaean system where living 
organisms are classified into groups depending on their structure and characteristics. 
This system was developed in the 18th century by Carl Linnaeus.  Although Linnaeus is 
now considered the father of taxonomy, his success rested on the work of his 
predecessors. So, the Linnaean system actually dates back to the time of Aristotle, 
possibly earlier, where life is classified in taxonomical rank, in groups, within a 
hierarchy. 
 
To accommodate a plethora of new species – aliens, reanimation of extinct species and 
entities, genetically modified organisms, and synthetic biology – a new system was 
coined by Julian Huxley in 1957 – one based on clade instead of rank. The idea of “a 
clade” did not exist before Charles Darwin and his evolutionary taxonomy.  It’s unlikely 
that Johns Hopkins was unaware of the implications when they named a 2018 
pandemic tabletop exercise “Clade X”.  A clade consists of an organism and all of its 
descendants. For example, the shared ancestor of apes and that entire species-
descendant species would comprise a “clade.” The term “clade” comes from the Greek 
“klados,” for “branch.” It’s useful to think of a clade as being one “branch” on the tree of 
life, where the common ancestor is the place that the branch split from the main trunk. 
 
What Clade X revealed was that a committee had spent ten years making a new 
classification for life called the PhyloCode. “In the Linnaean system a human was a 
human, a bird was bird, and a reptile was a reptile – everybody could clearly see it, it 
was common sense.  The PhyloCode makes room in the tree to mix and match: for lots 
of hybrids, synthetics, demons, spirits, synthetic life forms, aliens, whatever new 
species they knew was going to be in a cosmic ray high – which we are in right now – 
which tends to mutate all life forms.  They knew this was coming because it is on a 
cycle. It was on a 12,000-year cycle,”  Celeste Solum explained.  She goes on to say if 
anyone wants to learn what the government knows about the mutation of all life there is 
a book, ‘The Adam and Eve Story’, written by a CIA agent.  This book was declassified 
approximately three years ago, “you can find the sanitized version of this story at the 
CIA Reading Room,” Celeste Solum said.  

https://ibol.org/
https://ibol.org/phase1/cbol/
https://boldsystems.org/
https://phe.rockefeller.edu/research/barcode/
https://www.cbd.int/gti/taxonomy.shtml
https://davesgarden.com/guides/articles/view/2051
https://davesgarden.com/guides/articles/view/2051
https://julianhuxleyeugenics.blogspot.com/p/huxley-and-eugenics.html
https://link.springer.com/article/10.1007/s12064-020-00326-2
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Evolutionary_taxonomy
https://www.centerforhealthsecurity.org/our-work/events/2018_clade_x_exercise/
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/PhyloCode
https://www.nasa.gov/topics/solarsystem/features/ray_surge.html
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In another article I shared the once held CIA secret, the fact that the Sun Nova’s every 
12,068 years.  Since we are just 25 years away there is a grand plan to catalog every 
living thing.  A Nova of the Sun will occur in 2046. 
 
Deep in the bowels of an icy mountain on an island above the Arctic Circle between 
Norway and the North Pole lays a resource of vital importance for the future of 
human­kind. It’s not coal, oil or precious minerals, but seeds. 
 
Millions of these tiny brown specks, from more than 930,000 varieties of food crops, are 
stored in the Global Seed Vault on Spitsbergen, part of Norway’s Svalbard archipelago. 
It is essentially a huge safety deposit box, holding the world’s largest collection of 
agricultural biodiversity. “Inside this building is 13,000 years of agricultural history,” says 
Brian Lainoff, lead partnerships coordinator of the Crop Trust, which manages the vault, 
as he hauls open the huge steel door leading inside the mountain.  Secretly, this seed 
vault is intended to restart human life form after the Sun Nova’s in 2046, and the next 
ice age melts.  The problem is that might be as long as a thousand years after the Sun 
melts the forecasted 4,000-ft. of ice that will cover the Earth. 

 
 
The PhyloCode has rearranged classifications. Humans are in the same family as 
arthropods, dinosaurs and birds. “It mixes and matches and makes no sense.  But this 
is by design because with genetic modification they are mixing the species like 
crazy.  No longer will any life from be pure.  Their goal is to taint every single life form,” 
Solum said.  And, why would they do that?  Because they cannot patent something from 
the “old world”, in other words natural life forms, Solum said, they can only patent a new 
life form.  
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The nations unite under one code 

The World Organization for Animal Health (“OIE”) is essentially the United Nations 
(“UN”) management of life on earth.  There is a Terrestrial Animal Health Code 
(“TAHC”) in which humans are included as animals.  There is also an Aquatic Animal 
Health Code dealing with life under the sea. 
  
From OIE’s “Codes and Manuals” landing page, select “Terrestrial Manual” from the left-
hand side menu, and surprisingly it opens a page titled “Manual of Diagnostic Tests and 
Vaccines for Terrestrial Animals.”  It states the manual “aims to facilitate international 
trade in animals and animal products and to contribute to the improvement of animal 
health services world-wide.”  Either of the previous statements on their own is bizarre 
but it becomes alarming considering the TAHC includes humans as animals. 
 
The UN’s Food and Agriculture Organization (“FAO”) has a manual, “Stamping Out”, 
which outlines how to dispose of animals for disease eradication. It gives procedures of 
how to dispose of different species using, for example, firearms and gaseous or 
injectable agents.  Although it does not mention the human species, we must remember 
the TAHC includes humans as animals.  At the moment the medical codes, which were 
renewed in the last couple of years, permit humane killing by gassing, guillotine or being 
stabbed by a sharp object such as a syringe.  And doctors will get paid for it. 
Further reading 
Epic Battle of the Alien Alignment 
The Adam and Eve Story 
Phylocode 
Terrestrial Animal Health Code 
Aquatic Animal Health Code 
OIE Codes and Manuals 
FAO Manual on Procedures for Disease Eradication by Stamping Out 
 
According to Solum, there are military documents which distinguish between the “old 
humans” and the “new humans.”  The UN’s Agenda 21, and its successor Agenda 
2030, has been brought forward.  By 2025 they want all the “old humans” 
eradicated and any human from then on will be engineered in the 
laboratory.  According to the WEF “by 2025 they do not want us to take anything from 
nature, anything we consume will be laboratory generated,” Solum said.  Are you 
sensing Covid-19 was a global experiment and we are the ferrets? 
 
What is the relevance of all this now? 
In January 2020, Celeste Solum attended the WEF forum and was horrified to discover 
that the plans were already “operational.”  Solum said, “This Covid situation is the 
first deployment of a construct, a new life form if you will. It is not a virus it is a 
nano synthetic biological.” 
 
Celeste Solum explaining how elements of the “Covid situation” are the first deployment 
of a construct or a new life form as part of the Barcode of Life initiative.  

https://shepherdsheart.life/blogs/news/epic-battle-of-the-alien-alignment?_pos=2&_sid=635ab8f3e&_ss=r
https://www.cia.gov/readingroom/document/cia-rdp79b00752a000300070001-8
http://phylonames.org/code/
https://www.oie.int/en/what-we-do/standards/codes-and-manuals/terrestrial-code-online-access/
https://www.oie.int/en/what-we-do/standards/codes-and-manuals/aquatic-code-online-access/
https://www.oie.int/en/what-we-do/standards/codes-and-manuals/
http://www.fao.org/3/y0660e/Y0660E.htm
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/agenda-2030-delivering-the-global-goals
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/agenda-2030-delivering-the-global-goals
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Further reading: 
‘Human barcode’ could make society more organized, but invades privacy, civil liberties 
– NY Daily News 
Ecology Briefs, Informative Bulletin of the Centro Internacional de Ecología Tropical 
(CIET, Caracas) – Ask 
Aldevron the First to Rapidly Discover Human Antibodies Using Ligand’s OmniRat® 
Platform and Berkeley Lights’ Beacon® Instrument 
Berkeley Lights’ Beacon single B cell screening and selection platform 
 

It sounds like science fiction? 
For the sake of brevity, let us consider only a few of the things we already know.  Keep 
in mind only a fraction of the technological advancements and what is already in play is 
in the public domain, and new pieces of the puzzle are “coming out” all the time. 
 
Transhumanism. According to the UK government, The Fourth Industrial Revolution “is 
characterized by a fusion of technologies – such as artificial intelligence, gene editing 
and advanced robotics.”  In other words, it is characterized by trans-
humanism.  According to the Chicago Council on Global Affairs, and as a basis of an 
event in May 2019, The Fourth Industrial Revolution had already begun.  One speaker 
at the event was Klaus Schwab, Founder and Executive Chairman of the WEF. 
 
Klaus Schwab has said: The Fourth Industrial Revolution will “lead to a fusion of our 
physical, digital and biological identity,” Chicago Council on Global Affairs, May 2019  
 
New life forms. In 2010, Dr. Craig Venter created the world’s first synthetic life form.  In 
January 2020, a research team of roboticists and scientists published their recipe for 
making a new lifeform called xenobots.  In 2019, a Spanish scientist claimed to have 
grown the world’s first-ever human-monkey hybrid.  Covid-19 was a “synthetic” virus, 
and you need to understand what that means.  It was created on a computer screen!  
You might consider it like when you last took your vehicle to the garage for an oil 
change, you may have switched from petroleum-base engine oil to the synthetic oils.  
Synthetic engine lubricants began in 1929 but only became popular in the last few 
decades.  The future is all about the “new” or “synthetic” life form. 
 
Advancement of technologies. Neuro technologies are based on various tools  to 
access and affect structures and functions of the brain that may be involved in 
cognition, emotion and behaviors. And they are far more advanced than we can 
imagine.  In 2021, tiny robots were developed that would precisely deliver drugs to the 
central nervous system.  And, a quick browse of a 2001 NASA document, ‘Future 
Strategic Issues/Future Warfare [Circa 2025]’, reads like science fiction.  As does a 
Pentagon briefing in 2005 regarding a project to develop a “virus” or “vaccine”, by 
targeting an area in the brain, against religious fundamentalism. 
 
In 2005, a Pentagon briefing was held by an unknown scientist on removing the so-
called “god gene” – “Funvax”   A leaked cell phone video shows Bill Gates doing a 
presentation on the “Funvax”. 

https://newworldorder666.wordpress.com/2012/06/04/human-barcode-could-make-society-more-organized-but-invades-privacy-civil-liberties-ny-daily-news/
https://newworldorder666.wordpress.com/2012/06/04/human-barcode-could-make-society-more-organized-but-invades-privacy-civil-liberties-ny-daily-news/
https://mallet.oeb.harvard.edu/files/malletlab/files/mallet09_barcoding.pdf
https://mallet.oeb.harvard.edu/files/malletlab/files/mallet09_barcoding.pdf
https://uk.news.yahoo.com/aldevron-first-rapidly-discover-human-110000031.html?guccounter=1&guce_referrer=aHR0cHM6Ly9kdWNrZHVja2dvLmNvbS8&guce_referrer_sig=AQAAALcZk8M8YCDwDGY4gQoOxiaOUndMk3G0gLdZhDYx67Ed0XkpWLWoPMvxKUb6yfe76FaAMKyBsIwx28oQCRwVlkvxK2ruzQkWsImMpnzznJH4ayV0fTjuL3j38lW45zUNjc7x85HgXxCmGbxuAs6M3r7iWQnTb7fr-_dVfYuV2q4S
https://uk.news.yahoo.com/aldevron-first-rapidly-discover-human-110000031.html?guccounter=1&guce_referrer=aHR0cHM6Ly9kdWNrZHVja2dvLmNvbS8&guce_referrer_sig=AQAAALcZk8M8YCDwDGY4gQoOxiaOUndMk3G0gLdZhDYx67Ed0XkpWLWoPMvxKUb6yfe76FaAMKyBsIwx28oQCRwVlkvxK2ruzQkWsImMpnzznJH4ayV0fTjuL3j38lW45zUNjc7x85HgXxCmGbxuAs6M3r7iWQnTb7fr-_dVfYuV2q4S
https://genovac.com/solutions/single-b-cell-platforms/
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=CVIy3rjuKGY
https://theexpose.uk/2021/07/26/scientists-want-to-insert-their-mark-be-called-your-creator-and-own-you/
https://phys.org/news/2020-01-bot-beast-scientists-programmable.html?fbclid=IwAR2aqkSuSzV3TUA83wbma_qDwNRkHEyFgJLz2TsTvbAUz1VLddZu-kYcuIU
https://latestnewstelecast.com/spanish-scientist-claims-to-have-grown-the-worlds-first-ever-human-monkey-hybrid/
https://theexpose.uk/2021/07/24/bio-weapons-brain-machine-interface-covid-vaccine/
https://www.news-medical.net/news/20210810/Tiny-tumbling-soft-robots-could-precisely-deliver-drugs-to-central-nervous-system.aspx
https://archive.org/details/FutureStrategicIssuesFutureWarfareCirca2025/mode/2up
https://archive.org/details/FutureStrategicIssuesFutureWarfareCirca2025/mode/2up
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=spw5nmUrpWA
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=spw5nmUrpWA
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Pentagon-briefing-on-removing-the-god-gene-funvaxDownload 
 
Covid technologies deployed. Graphene has been found in Covid injections and in 
face masks.  Once integrated with neuron cells graphene oxide nanoparticles act as 
nano biosensors which have two functions, namely: collect electrical signals of our 
impulses and thoughts or brain mapping; and, neuro-modulate our behaviors, emotions 
and feelings. 
 
A scientific study has confirmed that mRNA can alter your DNA. The Pfizer/BioNTech 
and Moderna “vaccines” are RNA injections, these transfect their RNA into the 
cytoplasm of our cells.  Through a process called reverse-transcription, injected RNA 
integrates into our DNA. The Oxford/AstraZeneca and Johnson & Johnson “vaccines” 
are DNA, or viral vector, injections, which transfect DNA into the nucleus of our cells.  
The bottom line is to “upgrade” or change your God-given DNA.   
 
Do Celeste Solum’s claims seem so outlandish now?   
 
Completed in April 2003, the Human Genome Project (HGP) gave us the ability to read 
nature's complete genetic blueprint for a human. On April 14, 2003, the International 
Human Genome Sequencing Consortium announces the successful completion of the 
Human Genome Project. This was more than two years ahead of schedule.  As I noted, 
the Covid-19 virus was created for the Vaxx.  It was the only way the powers at be could 
get a world population to take a Vaxx for something unknown and labeled as a 
pandemic sufficient enough to scare people into thinking Covid-19 was like AIDS or 
Ebola.  These people began an earnest attempt to get people to provide their DNA 
through promoting the idea you might be a relative of a famous person in history.  Since 
about 2015, DNA testing kits were being offered to the public.  “23 and Me” sells a DNA 
kit for $99.   
 
“Simply provide your saliva sample from home. Mail it back to our lab in the same kit it 
came in—the postage is pre-paid. We bring your genetics to you!”  
 
It really sounded good until I was reading reports that “23 and Me” were sharing their 
samples with the FBI, who have other reasons for wanting people’s DNA.  What many 
thought to be a lark and fun to learn if they were related to a famous person, really had 
nefarious objectives piggybacked onto those DNA samples.     
 
This international effort to sequence the 3 billion DNA letters in the human genome is 
considered by many to be one of the most ambitious scientific undertakings of all time, 
even compared to splitting the atom or going to the moon. 
 
The finished sequence produced by the Human Genome Project covers about 99% of 
the human genome's gene-containing regions, and it has been sequenced to an 
accuracy of 99.99%. In addition, to help researchers better understand the meaning of 
the human genetic instruction book, the project took on a wide range of other goals, 

https://theexpose.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/08/Pentagon-briefing-on-removing-the-god-gene-funvax.pdf
https://theexpose.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/08/Pentagon-briefing-on-removing-the-god-gene-funvax.pdf
https://theexpose.uk/2021/07/10/the-real-pandemic-covid-19-or-graphene-oxide-poisonous-nano-material-found-in-covid-vaccines-and-face-masks/
https://theexpose.uk/2021/07/10/the-real-pandemic-covid-19-or-graphene-oxide-poisonous-nano-material-found-in-covid-vaccines-and-face-masks/
https://theexpose.uk/2021/08/15/scientific-study-finds-mrna-can-alter-your-dna/
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from sequencing the genomes of model organisms to developing new technologies to 
study whole genomes. 
 
Besides delivering on the stated goals below, the international network of researchers 
has produced an amazing array of advances that most scientists had not expected until 
much later. These "bonus" accomplishments include: an advanced draft of the mouse 
genome sequence, published in December 2002; an initial draft of the rat genome 
sequence, produced in November 2002; the identification of more than 3 million human 
genetic variations, called single nucleotide polymorphisms (SNPs); and the generation 
of full-length complementary DNAs (cDNAs) for more than 70 percent of known human 
and mouse genes. 
 
It’s been 20 years since scientists published the first draft of the human genome. Since 
its launch in the 90s, the HGP fundamentally altered how we understand our genetic 
blueprint, our evolution, and the diagnosis and treatment of diseases. It spawned 
famous offspring, including gene therapy, mRNA vaccines, and CRISPR. It’s the parent 
to HGP-Write, a global consortium that seeks to rewrite life.  What we have been 
put through the past 22-months has everything to do with the “rewriting of life.” 
 
Yet as genome sequencing costs and time continue to decline, the question remains: 
what have we actually learned from the HGP? After two decades, is it becoming 
obsolete, with a new generation of genomic data in the making? And with controversial 
uses such as designer babies, human-animal chimeras, organs-in-a-tube, and shaky 
genetic privacy, how is the legacy of the HGP guiding the future of humanity?  Science 
has advanced to the point now that rivals the Creator’s role referred to in Isaiah 14:13-
14.  Man now controls the creation process! 
 
“For thou hast said in thine heart, I will ascend into heaven, I will exalt my throne 
above the stars of God: I will sit also upon the mount of the congregation, in the 
sides of the north:  14I will ascend above the heights of the clouds; I will be like 
the most High.” 
 
In a special issue of ‘Science’, scientists across the globe took a deep dive into the 
lessons learned from the world’s first biomedical moonshot. “Although some hoped 
having the human genome in hand would let us sprint to medical miracles, the field is 
more an ongoing relay race of contributions from genomic studies,” wrote ‘Science’ 
senior editor Laura Zahn. 
 
Decoding, reworking, and potentially one day augmenting the human genome is an 
ultra-marathon, buoyed by potential medical miracles and fraught with possible abuses. 
China has stated their plans to create “super soldiers” through “synthetic biology.” 
 
“As genomic data and its uses continue to balloon, it will be critical to curb potential 
abuse and ensure that the legacy of the HGP contributes to the betterment of all human 
lives,” wrote Drs. Jennifer Rood and Aviv Regev at Genentech in a perspectives article 
for the issue. 
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An Apollo Program to Decode Life 
Big data projects are a dime a dozen these days. A global effort to solve the brain? Yup. 
Scouring centenarians’ genes to find those that lead to longevity? Sure! Spitting in a 
tube to find out your ancestry and potential disease risks—the kits are on sale for the 
holidays! Genetically engineering anything—from yeast that brew insulin to an organism 
entirely new to Earth—been there, done that! 
 
These massive international collaborations and sci-fi stretch goals that we now take for 
granted owe their success to the HGP. It’s had a profound effect on biomedical 
research. 
 
Flashback to the 1990s. “Pulp Fiction” played in theaters, Michael Jordan owned the 
NBA, and an international team decided to crack the base code of human life. 
 
The study arose from years of frustration that genetic mapping tools needed better 
resolution. Scientists could roughly track down a gene related to certain types of genetic 
disorders, like Huntington’s disease, which is due to a single gene mutation. But it soon 
became clear that most of our toughest medical foes, such as cancer, often have 
multiple genetic hiccups. With the tools that were available at the time, solving these 
disorders was similar to debugging thousands of lines of code through a fogged-up lens. 
The disorder known as Huntingdon’s disease is where genetics and I became forever a 
student of genetics.  In 1966, my wife was expecting our first child and was 
experiencing epileptic seizures and after a series of tests was subsequently diagnosed 
with Huntingdon’s disease.  Since that turning point in my life, I have been engaged in a 
life-long study of the Code of Life!  I might as well have changed my vocation from that 
point as genetics has dominated my spare time over the decades since.  My pastor’s 
library contains a significant presence of books on what we refer to as the Code of Life.   
 
Ultimately, the pioneers realized we needed an “infinitely dense” map of the genome to 
really begin decoding, said the authors. Meaning, we needed a whole picture of the 
human genome, at high resolution, and the tools to get it. Before the HGP, we were 
peeking at our genome through consumer binoculars. After it, we got the James Webb 
space telescope to look into our inner genetic universe. 
 
The result was a human “reference genome,” a mold that nearly all biomedical studies 
map onto, from synthetic biology to chasing disease-causing mutants to the creation of 
CRISPR. Massive global consortiums, including the 1000 Genomes Project, the Cancer 
Genome Atlas, the BRAIN Initiative, and the Human Cell Atlas have all followed in 
HGP’s steps. As a first big data approach to medicine, before the internet was 
ubiquitous, HGP laid out a new vision for collaborative science by openly sharing data 
from labs across the globe—something Covid-19 vaccines have benefited from. 
 
Yet as with AOL, CDs, and Microsoft FrontPage, HGP may be a legacy product from a 
bygone era.  I would estimate that I have read four hundred scientific papers on the 
HGP and related genetic issues. 
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The Next Generation 
The first relatively finished reference genome was published in 2003. Yet two core 
questions at the heart of the HGP remain. One, what exactly should be considered a 
“complete reference”? Two, how can it be decoded to benefit humans? 
 
“Reference” is an ambiguous idea in the age of increasingly cheaper genome 
sequencing. The original reference was what science considered an “average” human. 
It wasn’t, but the reference genome did focus on mapping the most common variants in 
a gene. Yet it’s increasingly obvious that humans are wildly diverse in our genetic 
differences, which could—for example—have a say in our longevity. 
 
“Capturing the ever-growing genetic diversity of humans requires profiling a more 
diverse set of genomes,” said the authors. “Ultimately, although highly useful, a single 
reference genome is inherently biased.” Your genealogy results from consumer kits, for 
example, could be on point or off base, depending on your race and the genetic 
background of their reference samples. For now, it’s mostly people with European 
ancestry.  I have been asked to provide cheek swaps at least a half-dozen times.  I 
long-ago vowed never to surrender my DNA.  The importance of that decision proved a 
wise decision since every person tested for Covid-19 or submitted to the Vaxxes gave 
away their individual identity.  It is a very complex matter and its importance is not a 
minor issue since the CCP has been acquiring that data from DNA ancestry agencies.  
  
How exactly do they get this sensitive information?  Buying American companies which 
have DNA profiles, subsidizing DNA analysis for ancestry companies, and hacking. 
Some 50-million have had their DNA tested.  Would you want your DNA or other 
healthcare data going to an authoritarian regime with a record of exploiting DNA for 
repression and surveillance? For years, the People’s Republic of China (PRC) has 
collected large healthcare data sets from the U.S. and nations around the globe, 
through both legal and illegal means, for purposes only it can control. While no one 
begrudges a nation conducting research to improve medical treatments, the PRC’s 
mass collection of DNA at home has helped it carry out human rights abuses against 
domestic minority groups and support state surveillance. The PRC’s collection of 
healthcare data from America poses equally serious risks, not only to the privacy of 
Americans, but also to the economic and national security of the U.S. 
 

The Value of Your DNA 
• Your DNA is the most valuable thing you own. It holds the most intimate details of your 
past, present and potential future—whether you are prone to addiction or high-risk for 
cancer. It is your unique genetic code and can enable tailored healthcare delivery to 
you. 
 
• Losing your DNA is not like losing a credit card. You can order a new credit card, but 
you cannot replace your DNA. The loss of your DNA not only affects you, but your 
relatives and, potentially, generations to come.  Your DNA today is the most coveted bit 
of information today for multiple reasons, some of which I have noted here. 
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China Prioritizes the Collection of Healthcare Data 
• The PRC views bulk personal data, including healthcare and genomic data, as a 
strategic commodity to be collected and used for its economic and national security 
priorities. (Genomic data is a broad term referring to your entire genetic sequence—all 
your DNA). 
 
• The PRC is investing heavily in the “biotech revolution” and has enacted national 
policies prioritizing the collection of healthcare data both at home and abroad to achieve 
its goal of becoming a global biotech leader. It has designated biotech as a “strategic 
emerging industry” and prioritized state support for its biotech industry in national plans 
like the Made in China 2025 plan. 
 
• The PRC understands the collection and analysis of large genomic data sets from 
diverse populations helps foster new medical discoveries and cures that can have 
substantial commercial value and advance its Artificial Intelligence and precision 
medicine industries. 
 
• In 2016, the PRC announced a $9 billion, 15-year project to collect, analyze, and 
sequence genomic data to become a global leader in precision medicine—a process 
designed to provide tailored treatments based on the genetic makeup and environment 
and lifestyle of individual patients. 
 
• With the COVID-19 pandemic, the PRC aggressively marketed Chinese COVID-19 
testing kits around the world, along with laboratories to support COVID-19 testing. By 
August 2020, China’s leading genomics company, BGI, said it had sold test kits to 180 
countries and established labs in 18 countries in the past six months. 
 
• According to the U.S.-China Economic and Security Review Commission, these 
COVID-19 labs have been providing Chinese researchers with access to healthcare 
data from around the globe.  Despite their aggressive pitches to U.S. states, there is no 
evidence Chinese companies have been able to establish such COVID-19 labs in the 
U.S. 
 

China’s Access to U.S. Healthcare Data 
• Nevertheless, the PRC has for years been able to gain access to U.S. healthcare data, 
including genomic data, through a variety of channels, both legal and illegal. 
 
• U.S. healthcare data may be particularly attractive and valuable to China because of 
the ethnic diversity of the U.S. population.  And compared to other nations, the U.S. has 
fewer safeguards on medical and healthcare data, including data for research 
purposes.6 U.S. safeguards focus primarily on privacy, not national security, which 
creates vulnerability for foreign actors to gain access to data on U.S. persons. 
 
• Over the years, Chinese companies have taken advantage of this environment by 
investing in U.S. firms that handle sensitive healthcare and other types of personal data, 
providing them entry to the U.S. market and access to this data. 
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• For instance, China’s BGI purchased U.S. genomic sequencing firm Complete 
Genomics in 2013. In 2015, China’s WuXi Pharma Tech acquired U.S. firm NextCODE 
Health to later form WuXi NextCODE Genomics. 
 
• Chinese companies have also gained access to U.S. healthcare data by partnering 
with hospitals, universities, and other research organizations in America. These U.S. 
entities routinely seek low-cost genomic sequencing services for their facilities, which 
Chinese biotech firms can often provide due to Chinese government subsidies. (In 
February 2020, BGI said it could sequence a human genome for just $100) These 
partnerships allow U.S. entities to expand their research capabilities, while Chinese 
firms gain access to more genetic data on more diverse sets of people, which they can 
use for new medical products and services. 
 
• A 2019 report found at least 15 Chinese companies that were either headquartered in 
China with a U.S. presence, or wholly located in China, were licensed to perform 
genetic testing or whole genomic sequencing on patients in the U.S. healthcare system, 
giving them direct access to the genetic data of patients in the U.S. 
 
• Finally, the PRC has gained access to U.S. healthcare data through illicit means, 
including theft of research and cyberattacks. 
 
• Among the most notorious examples was the 2015 hack of U.S.-based health insurer 
Anthem, Inc., in which data on some 78.8 million persons was stolen from Anthem’s 
computer networks, including health identification numbers, names, Social Security 
numbers, employment and income data and other information. A U.S. Justice 
Department indictment in 2019 charged two individuals based in China for the hack of 
Anthem and three other U.S. companies. 
 

China’s History of DNA Exploitation 
• Concerns over the exploitation of healthcare and genomic data by the PRC are not 
hypothetical. The PRC has a documented history of exploiting DNA for genetic 
surveillance and societal control of minority populations in Xinjiang, China. 
 
• Specifically, the PRC government has established a high-tech surveillance system 
across Xinjiang, as part of a province-wide apparatus of oppression aimed primarily 
against traditionally Muslim minority groups. An initiative launched by the PRC 
government in 2014 has been used to justify the collection of biometric data from all 
Xinjiang residents ages 12 to 65. Authorities have collected DNA samples, fingerprints, 
iris scans, and blood types. The biometric data is linked to individuals’ identification 
numbers and centralized in a searchable database used by PRC authorities. 
 
• Specific abuses by the PRC government as part of this effort include mass arbitrary 
detentions, severe physical and psychological abuse, forced labor, oppressive 
surveillance used arbitrarily or unlawfully, religious persecution, political indoctrination, 
and forced sterilization of members of minority groups in Xinjiang. All told, the PRC 
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government in Xinjiang has detained more than 1 million members of Muslim minority 
groups in internment camps for Communist Party indoctrination since 2017. 
 
• In July 2020, the U.S. Department of Commerce sanctioned two subsidiaries of 
China’s BGI for their role in conducting genetic analysis used to further the PRC 
government’s repression of Uyghurs and other Muslim minority groups in Xinjiang. 
 
• Over the past decade, China’s BGI has partnered with many research and healthcare 
entities in America to provide them with genomic sequencing services, while also 
gaining access to health records and genetic data on people in the U.S. 
 

Implications for Privacy and U.S. National Security 
• China’s access to U.S. healthcare and genomic data poses serious privacy and 
national security risks to the U.S. 
 
• Through its cyber intrusions in recent years, the PRC has already obtained the 
Personal Identifying Information (PII) of much of the U.S. population. 
 
• Recent breaches attributed to the PRC government or to cyber actors based in China 
include the theft of personnel records of roughly 21 million individuals from the U.S. 
Office of Personnel Management; the theft from Marriott hotels of roughly 400 million 
records; the theft of data from Equifax on roughly 145 million people; and the theft of 
data from Anthem on roughly 78 million people. 
 
• Furthermore, under the PRC’s national security laws, Chinese companies are 
compelled to share data they have collected with the PRC government. Article 7 of 
China’s 2017 National Intelligence Law, for instance, mandates that all Chinese 
companies and citizens shall support, assist, and cooperate with Chinese national 
intelligence efforts, and guard the secrecy of any national intelligence work that they are 
aware of. There is no mechanism for Chinese companies to refuse their government’s 
requests for data. 
 
• The combination of stolen PII, personal health information, and large genomic data 
sets collected from abroad affords the PRC vast opportunities to precisely target 
individuals in foreign governments, private industries, or other sectors for potential 
surveillance, manipulation, or extortion. 
 
• For instance, vulnerabilities in specific individuals revealed by genomic data or health 
records could be used to help target these individuals.18 Data associated with an 
embarrassing addiction or mental illness could be leveraged for blackmail. Combine this 
information with stolen credit data indicating bankruptcy or major debt and the tools for 
exerting leverage increase. Such data sets could help the PRC not only recruit 
individuals abroad, but also act against foreign dissidents. 
 

Economic Implications for the United States 
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• Aside from these immediate privacy risks, China’s access to U.S. health and genomic 
data poses long-term economic challenges for the United States. 
 
• The PRC’s acquisition of U.S. healthcare data is helping to fuel China’s Artificial 
Intelligence and precision medicine industries, while the PRC severely restricts U.S. and 
other foreign access to such data from China, putting America’s roughly $100 billion 
biotech industry at a disadvantage. 
 
• Over time, this dynamic could allow China to outpace U.S. biotech firms with important 
new drugs and health treatments and potentially displace American firms as global 
biotech leaders. 
 
• Although new medicines coming out of China could benefit U.S. patients, America 
could be left more dependent on Chinese innovation and drug development for its 
cures, leading to a transfer of wealth, co-opting of new businesses and greater job 
opportunities in China. 
 
“The HGP and its legacy must serve humanity as a whole, not neglecting those who are 
currently underrepresented in biological research,” the team said. 
 
Then there’s making sense of it. The HGP itself decoded the genome but didn’t provide 
an understanding of it - such as what genetic elements actually do, how they work 
together, and how they contribute to health and disease. 
 
We’re getting there, but slowly. We’ve found genes that protect against Alzheimer’s, and 
genes that contribute to cancer and muscle disorders. Using a popular method called 
GWAS (genome-wide association study), scientists are increasingly capable of fishing 
out gene variants - often hundreds at a time - that play a role in more complex disorders 
such as autism. But teasing out how bucket loads of genes affect any disease remains 
difficult. With the rise of machine learning and AI, however, the authors said, we have a 
powerful tool to begin “unpacking its secrets to affect health.”  This information works 
both ways, positive or negative. 
 
What’s next? Thanks to ongoing massive whole genome sequencing projects, we could 
be shedding the veil of HGP’s “average” human and entering a new era of multiple 
reference genomes - or even personalized ones. With this would come massive 
concerns around privacy. The Golden State Killer case, though it had a “happy” ending 
in that it was ultimately solved, relied on a free and public genealogy database that 
people may not have knowingly agreed to partake in. Unexpected findings related to 
long-lost relatives, or paternity issues, a high risk of serious diseases, or our own 
heritage, especially if shared with third parties, could damage relationships or even 
overthrow our sense of self.  Consider how insurance companies can use such 
information to preclude an individual from obtaining life insurance or be disqualified from 
employment based upon your genetic profile, or require higher insurance premiums for 
said insurance coverage. 
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From the idea of a reference genome to a smorgasbord of genetic tools, HGP’s legacy 
is here to stay. As we move towards a more “snowflake” era of genomics—one that 
stresses individuality either for mixed-and-matched groups or individuals—the original 
goal remains the same. 
 
The project left us with a major mission, still relevant even 20 years later, and the 
authors said. We need to better understand how to wield our genetic blueprints, both 
common and rare, to “promote human health and treat disease” - for all of humanity. 
 
As this larger story has been unfolding over the past two years, the underlying story is 
convoluted in such a way as to totally confuse the world.  The Covid-19 crime is more of 
a three-strand rope binding the issues into an enigma virtually inseparable.  Covid-19 
was created from “synthetic biology”, on a computer in a laboratory.  Stop and think 
about what I just stated and what that really means, Covid-19 was not a novel virus, not 
a rogue virus, but was created by combining genetic genome fragments, hence creating 
a “new” virus. 
 
The world was told in early 2020 by Dr. Anthony Fauci and others Covid-19 was a 
pandemic and we were told it could kill 65-million people.  The truth of this story is that 
Covid-19 was being tested for twenty years prior, with the purpose of creating a lethal 
weapon.  The WHO, the CDC, NIH, NIAID, and the many agencies Bill Gates was 
financially involved with lied to the world, yet they walk the streets as free men for their 
murders!  
 
We have learned of three toxins in the Vaxxes over the past six months:  Graphene 
Oxide, a spike protein (PEG), and Polysorbate 80.  Today, we learned of another 
strange ingredient reported by Lee Austin.  A Polish doctor discovered something called 
Hydra Vulgaris: Eternal, Serpent Embryo, contained In the jab?  
 
The Hydra is named after the serpent in Greek mythology that grew two new heads for 
each one cut off. The Hydra Vulgaris is a tiny, tentacled, palm tree shaped, sentient 
freshwater invertebrate, comprised of stem cells which appear to renew themselves. In 
other words, hydra vulgaris contains the genomic code for eternal life. Over a period of 
twenty days the organism recreates itself.  This is the “Holy Grail” for the Satanic crowd 
seeking to find immortality!  It is central to the scientific/medical complex agenda today. 
 
According to Assistant Professor Celina Juliano, with the Department of Molecular and 
Cellular Biology, “As far as we can tell, it doesn’t age or die, You can cut little pieces out 
of the animal and it will regrow and maybe the most amazing thing is that you can 
dissociate the animal into single cells, mix them all up, put them back in a ball and a 
new Hydra will just grow out of it.”  
 
Discovered in 1744 by Abraham Trembley the creature’s ability to regenerate itself is 
still an unknown. Professor Juliano added “If you or I were injured, say our hands were 
cut off, there’s a specific genetic program that is activated and is required to heal the 
wound, but the hand wouldn’t grow back. That same genetic program is activated after 
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injury throughout the animal kingdom, but in some cases, instead of triggering scarring, 
it triggers regeneration and thus the missing body part is replaced.”  
 
Stem cells are the cornerstone of any living entity. As the embryo grows, stem cells take 
on individual characteristics. Over time they lose their ability to replace aging cells and 
eventually die. Conversely, the Hydra stem cells regenerate and are also known as 
Hydra the eternal embryo. Somehow the Hydra is able to keep its genome while 
experiencing large scale cell division. The Hydra is in a constant state of rebirth.  
 
So what is the purpose of injecting Hydra Vulgaris into the human body? Could it be 
consuming the nervous system? Considering each Hydra has four to twelve tentacles 
which extend from its mouth, grabbing ahold of an internal food source isn’t an obstacle. 
Anything that cannot be digested is regurgitated through the mouth. Because it lacks a 
backbone the Hydra Vulgaris can bend over and attach itself to other surfaces. 
  
In addition to Graphene Oxide is Hydra Vulgaris the other proprietary ingredient big 
pharma conveniently excluded from their witches brew? Constructing an internal self-
replicating synthetic neural network by penetrating the blood brain barrier; and external 
control of man’s body soul and spirit has been suggested.  
 
Somehow the stem cells present in the COVID-19 injections appear to have a direction 
connection to Hydra Vulgaris. There are two different aborted stem cell lines, one male, 
one female, available in the operating system. 
  
The WI-38 female stem cell line was extracted from the lung tissue of an aborted three 
month old female fetus. The fetus was the result of an elective abortion by a Swedish 
woman in 1962, and was then used without her permission or knowledge. Get that in 
your hard drive. The aborted stem cell line contained in the jab was the result of murder, 
theft and sorcery.  
 
The other stem cell line present in the injection is the MRC-5 male stem cell line In this 
instance, the stem cells were extracted from the lung tissue of a fourteen week male 
fetus aborted in 1966.  
 
When the WI-38 stem cell line is injected into a male, the female Y chromosome 
conflicts with the natural X chromosome of the male and can lead to hormonal gender 
confusion and a lack of desire to procreate. If the man feels like he’s a woman, trapped 
in man’s body, the propensity to be attracted to the opposite sex is eliminated. And 
within one generation, the man’s paternal lineage is eliminated. Multiplied by billions of 
COVID19 vaccines, the world’s population could be reduced drastically in a couple of 
decades.  This has profound implications that prove gender confusion which in thirty 
years has went from 1% of the population to almost 5% has a biochemical origin.  Soy 
products have been known for years to be a causal factor of gender confusion. 
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Conversely, when the MRC-5 male stem cell line is introduced into a female, the male X 
chromosome conflicts with the natural Y chromosome of the female and can lead to 
hormonal gender confusion and the lack of a natural maternal desire to have children. 
  
The injection is also filled with a cornucopia of elements and metals detrimental to the 
human body; Aluminum, a leading cause of Alzheimer’s disease. Formaldehyde, also 
known as embalming fluid; Thimerosal, which is 49.6% mercury. Acetone, an element 
present in nail polish remover. And of course the aforementioned aborted fetus stem 
cell lines.  
 
Follow the symbols. The world is ruled by symbols. For example the symbol of medicine 
is the caduceus. The traditional symbol of Hermes, features two snakes winding around 
a winged staff. I’m sure it’s just another coincidence the symbol of the Baphomet has a 
staff protruding from his crotch, and two snakes winding around the staff. The 
Baphomet also features two female breasts. In essence, the Baphomet is a 
hermaphrodite, a person or animal having both male and female sex organs. On the 
arms of the Baphomet are the words “Solve” and “Co-ag-ula” which means to 
breakdown and rebuild or “The Great Work of Alchemy.”  
 

 
 
In the mystery religions, Alchemy is the process of turning lead into gold by utilizing the 
esoteric Philosopher’s Stone. From this alchemist’s desire to cure all ailments and 
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achieve eternal life apart from God!  Alchemy’s symbols include the signs of the zodiac, 
twin-coiled serpents, and the Freemasonic bronze pillars of Jachin and Boaz. 
  
Spiritually, Alchemy is the occultic science and black magic art of unifying matter and 
spirit. Kabbalists believe Jacob’s Ladder to be a powerful alchemical vision, revealing 
super-consciousness as Jacob laid his head upon the stone. This is the genesis of the 
philosopher’s stone. In conclusion, if you’ll begin to view the COVID-19 vaccine 
deception through spiritual eyes, then everything will begin to come into focus.   
Researchers at UC Davis, and a Polish scientist examined a vial of vaccine and were 
able to find the presence of Hydra Vulgaris in the shot.  It gets weirder by the week in 
this grand experiment on the guinea pigs of the world, i.e., human beings!   
 

 
 
‘As Above, [So] Below’ is one in the same however, as under Luciferianism, it’s about 
combining extremes. “Fauci’s also been shown doing the right hand ‘as above’ sign. 
Pure good & pure evil. It is believed under Luciferianism that enlightenment comes from 
embracing these extremes. To know Heaven you must know Hell.  “That’s what they 
believe. Or rather, this is what they tell themselves to justify unspeakable actions.”  The 
right hand simply provides cover for the left hand, to give the illusion of benevolence.  
 
Brandon Campbell writing for Ultimate-Survival, a UK site posted an article a month ago 
that pulls back further the curtain shrouding the Covid-19 con.  It was titled, “Guinea 
Pigs United – Is Mass Vaccination Creating New Strains? Covid-19, the virus that was 
supposed to disappear from our lives, mutated into something else. (THE DESIGN 
PARAMETERS OF THIS BIO-WEAPON WERE DESIGNED TO MUTATE, 
ONCE RELEASED.)” 
 

https://billkloss.law.blog/
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“Not many countries are brave or reckless enough to execute a vast medical experiment 
on their entire population and put vulnerable people at risk. Britain and Israel did.”  
 
On December 8, 2020, Britain was the first Western country to start “immunizing its 
population.” Two weeks later, just a few days before Christmas, Britain grasped that it 
was in serious trouble. Covid-19, the virus that was supposed to disappear from our 
lives, mutated into something else. On December 19, 2020, PM Boris Johnson admitted 
that British scientists had identified a new Covid-19 mutant that is ‘70% more 
transmissible’ than its ancestors.  Where is the proof of such a claim? The public was 
entitled to proof but got, “you have to trust the science!”   Britain introduced tighter local 
restrictions, yet despite these, along with the vast vaccination campaign, the numbers of 
Covid-19 cases, hospitalizations and deaths kept rising. They are escalating 
exponentially on a daily basis.  These allegations have never been proven to be true.  
They like the American health agencies have never proved the existence of a Covid-19 
or any mutant or variant.  No lab in the world has put Covid-19 to the test of the Gold 
Standard of Koch Postulates.  There is a huge public disconnect from the 
pharmaceutical companies pushing their “gene” therapy, with the many unknown 
ingredients.   
 
Israel launched its mass vaccination campaign a few days after Britain. Within the 
next two weeks, Israel managed to vaccinate nearly 20% of its population. Israel is by 
far the world winner when it comes to the mass vaccination contest, but the country is 
also in big trouble. Like Britain, Israel is facing a huge Covid-19 surge. Its national 
health system is on the brink of collapse and the inevitable question is if these similar (if 
not identical) health crises are related to them both pioneering vast covid-19 vaccination 
campaigns. 
 
Today, in the biggest Israeli news outlet News12, Israeli computer scientists revealed 
that the British Mutation is about to become the dominant Covid-19 strain in 
Israel. You may wonder how the British mutant strain managed to make Aliya (ER: 
reference to Jews ‘returning’ to Israel) and settle so comfortably in the Jewish State. 
The News 12 article may answer the question: 
 
“Cases in Israel aren’t rising uniformly: there is a significant slowdown in the (Israeli) 
Arab sector, which in the past was the main area of concern. On the other hand, there 
is a major outbreak in the (Jewish) ultra-Orthodox sector. This week 1.3% of all 
ultra-Orthodox came out verified, and the rate of increase in cases of children (63%) this 
week was almost double that of adults. Among the ultra-Orthodox sector, there was 
a 16-fold increase in the number of verified people within four weeks: this is a doubling 
every week – from 100 verified people per day (per million people) to 1,600 verified 
people, and all within a month. Such a growth rate is not seen throughout the plague 
and is probably due at least in part to the British mutant. It is estimated that the 
British mutant is about 20% of all ultra-Orthodox verified.” 
 
This must raise eyebrows. Why would the British mutant strain spread so vastly 
amongst orthodox Jews? Why doesn’t it spread as quickly in the Arab population? 
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We may be able to stumble upon a very crucial piece of information here. Israeli Arabs 
may be doing better on the Covid-19 front because many of them seem to be 
reluctant about the vaccine. The Israeli ‘Marker’s’ headline on 27 December stated: 
“A cause for concern: (Israeli) Arabs do not come to get vaccinated.” The ‘Marker’ 
pointed out that Jewish citizens from all over Israel travel to Arab villages and cities to 
receive the vaccines that were designated to Arabs. According to a duty manager of a 
vaccination center in Nazareth, 70-80% of those who come to receive the vaccine 
were Jewish. Some of them travel as much as 50 km to do so. 
 
But the story doesn’t end here. On January 3, the Israeli news website Walla reported 
that “the ultra-Orthodox are leading the population vaccination campaign.” Walla 
confirmed that ‘the percentage of people vaccinated against corona among ultra-
Orthodox society is higher than the rest of the population of all ages.’ 
 
It is beyond me why the Israelis decided to become guinea pigs in this reckless 
unscientific experiment in human lives. One option that can’t be dismissed is that Israel 
is once again heading towards an election, and it is more than likely that Israel’s leaders 
believed that a mass vaccination campaign may translate into an electoral success. 
 
As things stand at the moment, it is hard to deny the possibility of a correlation between 
mass vaccination and a sharp spike in Covid-19 cases in both Israel and Britain. It is 
hard to deny the fact that Israeli Arabs who at large avoid the vaccine are doing far 
better than the Jewish orthodox who seem to also believe in Pfizer. 
 

'Food for Thought' Let This Sink In... 
‘Pfizer’ is a German word. 
  
I don't think they want you to figure this out...because you can use an English to 
German translator on Google... 
  
...or you can try the German to English translator and you get the same thing. 'Pfizer'  
 
My research shows Pfizer is the German word for “Lucifer”.  
 
Now you get it.  Think about that the rest of your day. 
 
Alongside the revelations about the British strain, we also learned about a South African 
strain that is highly dangerous and possibly resistant to the current vaccines. It takes 
very little research to figure out that South Africa, together with Brazil and Britain, 
had been the testing ground for new vaccine trials since September. It is hardly a 
secret anymore that this was at roughly the same time that the new mutants 
were discovered in Britain at least. 
 
Brandon Campbell points here at the devastating possibility of a link between mass 
vaccinations and Covid-19 spikes.  He states, “I am not qualified to support or explain 
the science that may cause this correlation. My facts are supported by data that is 
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available to the wider public through mainstream news outlets. I am not an 
epidemiologist or a virologist, and I really hope that people with the appropriate scientific 
training can refute the issues raised above.” 
 
Brandon Campbell has raised a serious issue here given the fact that Israelis have 
become spotlighted as guinea pigs.  Having the greatest percentage of its citizen’s 
vaxxed, it has become pusher of the booster program, which is beginning to like a 
genocide of holocaust proportion. 
 
It’s more than evident at this point in time that the Big Pharma-Great Reset globalist 
elite are currently committing human genocide, carrying out their eugenics depopulation 
agenda.  It has been my suspicion for quite some time that it was really aimed at the 
Biblical descendants of Abraham, Isaac, and Jacob.   
 
I would simply remind you that DNA testing was a major program during the 1990s 
when the Temple Institute and Jewish groups were seeking to identify Jews around the 
world who genetically fit the criteria as a Biblical descendant of the Levites. The reason 
for this was related to the fact that it was the tribe of Levi in Temple times, were the 
priestly tribe entrusted with the sacrifice and worship for the sacrificial system. With the 
Diaspora in 70 A.D. Jews fled to the four corners of the known world during the first 
century A.D. 
 

What other purpose can justify the mandate to vaxx the entire world for a virus with a 
recovery rate that is 99.996%, than genocidal depopulation, more specifically the 
Biblical descendants of Abraham, Isaac, and Jacob?    As Brandon Campbell notes the 
UK and Israel have led the campaign to vaxx the Jewish people, In the UK, 65% of 
Jews identify as Jewish Orthodox.  In the U.S., Jews number 6.5-million.  New York 
State, where the largest number of deaths attributed to Covid-19, the Jewish population 
is approximately 9% at 1.7-million.        

 
Unless you understand the Satanic agenda of the Bible, that of destroying the Jewish 
bloodline of Abraham, Isaac, and Jacob you will not see and grasp the larger picture of 
what we are witness to today.  There is a spiritual dimension here, which I have raised 
since the beginning of 2021, which is emerging into the public domain news.  As Dr. 
Fauci calls it “breakthrough” cases, (people who were fully vaccinated) becoming 
diagnosed as re-infected with Covid or a mutant variant are spiking across the Nation.  
That pattern is true in Israel today! 
 
Rabbi Yitschak Rudomin commented on the virus and the death of Jews in the U.S. 
during the summer of 2020.   
 
“How many Jews have died from the Coronavirus in the USA? This is a question that is 
never openly asked and studiously avoided. Why? If you live in America, as I do, it 
should be a very basic question, to know exactly what is going on around you. After all, 
doesn’t knowing this bolster the case of those who take it seriously, and counter the 
what-me-worry attitude of those who are ignoring social distancing?” 

https://www.globalresearch.ca/no-basis-benign-explanation-rush-stampede-human-herd-covid-jabs/5742129
https://www.bibliotecapleyades.net/sociopolitica2/sociopol_globalelite427.htm
https://www.globalresearch.ca/new-york-times-predicts-massive-population-reduction-alternative-thinking-may-overcome-our-predicament/5746382
https://www.globalresearch.ca/new-york-times-predicts-massive-population-reduction-alternative-thinking-may-overcome-our-predicament/5746382
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I just read an article claiming that Orthodox rabbis cannot agree on how and if to 
resume prayer Minyanim. Wouldn’t it help them decide if they could measure the scope 
of the tragedies around them? It would bring home the level of severity of this health 
crisis for those slacking off, and bring us face to face with the enormity of the losses 
American Jewry has suffered and confirm our need to mourn for the victims, particularly 
in Orthodox-Haredi-Hasidic-Sefardi circles in the New York-New Jersey metropolitan 
areas that have tragically been hit hard, and still are suffering. 
 
In Israel, the Jewish homeland where the situation was under control and is evidently 
improving (in early 2020), there is an exact count of Jews who have passed away from 
the Coronavirus. Reports say that of the almost 300 victims who have passed away, 
about 70% are from the Haredi sector. Recently there were news reports that in France 
between 1,000 to 2,000 French Jews have succumbed to the Coronavirus.  
 
The situation in the USA is most serious. As of May 2020 in America almost 100,000 
people died of Covid-19 and probably thousands of Jews in areas of Jewish 
concentration, but Jewish people are afraid to know the real numbers! 
 
United Kingdom, the British Jewish Board of Deputies keeps track of the number of 
Jews in Britain who have passed away, now approaching about 400. There was a report 
in an Israeli Haredi news source Pesach time 2020 that about 700 Orthodox Jews in the 
United States passed away from the Coronavirus. That was a report from Israel. It was 
not widely known, let alone reported in the USA. 
 
In America it is possible to Google “how many Americans have died from the 
coronavirus” and there are immediately detailed reports of the number of dead, infected, 
recovered overall and state by state. At the time of this writing, May 2020, the official 
figure of those who have died in America from Covid-19 is approaching 100,000! More 
than 20,000 in New York State and about 10,000 in New Jersey. No one is hiding the 
truth from anyone, but not so in the Orthodox world. 
 
I cannot help but compare the war we are waging against this malicious virus to the 
Holocaust. Although numerically there is no comparison, thank G-d, imagine if people 
found it “too disturbing” to hear how many Jews perished in the Holocaust, or how many 
died in various camps and ghettos in towns connected with survivors? If it is not “too 
disturbing” to “never forget” the Six Million victims of the Holocaust, so why is it “too 
disturbing” to be kept informed and made aware, and mourn for the victims of the 
Coronavirus? 
 
What does this avoidance and lack of critical information reveal? There are a number of 
possibilities: 
 
•The most basic reason given is that the various government authorities in the United 
States do not monitor or count victims by religion. Fair enough. A non-Jewish 
government is not obligated to do this. But why shouldn’t Jewish organizations, 
academics and communities do that? Many a Jewish study, or study of Jews, has 
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published reports of all sorts of detailed facts. Many community organizations have the 
staff and capability of keeping count of everything from homeless, to jobless, and 
numbers of students in Jewish school and yeshivas, so why not keep tabs of those who 
have fallen victim to the Coronavirus crisis in the midst of the crisis itself? 
 
•Fear and denial of reality. American Jews, like Americans generally are sunny-side-up 
positive thinkers, and they don’t like dealing and confronting the “D” word. 
 
•The splits and schisms between the various communities are a basic reason. Each 
group, such as the Yeshivish world, in Lakewood and Flatbush, the Hasidim are divided 
between each other. Satmar doesn’t know what goes on in Lubavitch, Boro Park 
doesn’t know what goes on Flatbush, Monsey and Kiryas Joel are worlds apart, 
Sefardim live a life apart from Ashkenazim, life in the Five Towns is split off from life in 
Lakewood, not to mention that the Haredi world is cut off from the Modern Orthodox 
world, and the Orthodox world is isolated from the secular Jewish world in America. So 
news, or lack thereof, about Jewish victims of the Coronavirus is a reflection of the 
socio-economic, cultural, geographic, and religious splits that exist on the ground. 
 
•Lack of any central body to do the job, like the Israeli government in Israel or the Board 
of Deputies in Britain. But this is not totally true because each large grouping in America 
has its centralized bodies and its official or unofficial information arms. There is the OU 
and the RCA, that keeps track of lots of things when they need to. There is the Agudah 
with its multiple branches with professionals who can dig up figures to argue any case in 
need. Satmar and Lubavitch have central rabbinical and communal organizations with 
powerful bureaucratic reach, all these could at least keep track of the numbers in their 
communities who have passed away that would help the living measure the seriousness 
of the pandemic and the need to continue with precautionary measures. It should not be 
too difficult for Yeshiva University and Touro College, both under Orthodox auspices, to 
find expert sociologists and analysts to compute the number of Coronavirus casualties 
in America. 
 
•Bottom line, the reality is that the Jewish people is as disunited during this time as it is 
in “the real world”. There is nothing now of the spirit in the Jewish world such as when 
Israel went through the 1967 Six Day War. Do you know how many Jews died in the Six 
Day War? Look it up. About 800. And how many Jews have died from the Coronavirus? 
In Israel almost 300, in Britain about 400, in France 1,000 to 2,000, and in America, let’s 
say not less than in France, so that is another 1,000 to 2,000 or more. More victims than 
the 3,000 people who died in the 9/11 attacks (obviously they were not all Jews either, 
but we know exactly how many died and their names have been memorialized in print 
and their names carved in stone in the 9/11 Memorial. Our current numbers of dead 
Jews is a lot for one Mageifa (plague) in LESS than three months, since March 2020. 
And yet, the Jewish leadership and media in America ignore stating the obvious facts 
and making everyone aware of the scope of this modern-day plague in our midst.” 
 
Early on in the Covid-19 issue, public health officials were reporting that blood-type AB 
seemed to have an affinity relationship.  We are not informed pertaining to such data 



25 
 

these days. In fact, there is nothing about whether Covid-19 was ever pre-disposed to 
specific ethnic groups.  In genetic studies being conducted by the CCP at Wuhan, China 
there were indicators where the CCP was active in locating racial genome that would 
enable them to attack a specific racial "Phenotype".  In plain terms, they were for 
looking for genetic information that could be used to attack a specific racial or ethnic 
population with a virus.   
 
Such a demonic agenda is all about what I have noted is example of how the science 
has been abused and has caused ethical and legal concerns within the IBOL 
community.  Their agenda as Celeste Solum indicated is to eliminate the “old” and 
bring in the “new” to life by 2025.  The larger issue is driven by their ability to patent 
new forms of life. 
 
In spite of Big Media’s censorship blackout as complicit murderers causing misinformed, 
lied to hundreds of thousands of innocent victims to die from the killer vaccines already, 
in response scores of leading medical doctors, expert scientists and insider 
whistleblowers at great risk to themselves have been shouting from rooftops to sound 
the apocalyptic alarm. 
 
Early on during the vaccine rollout, last February 2021, Dr. Sherry Tenpenny accurately 
predicted that by May through August, thousands of deaths from the vaccines will be 
falsely blamed on the fake variants. Outspoken Dr. Carrie Medej is now speaking out 
against the vaccine dangers through nano-technology and the transhumanist elements 
of how AI through nanoparticles in vaccines are merging with genetically modified GMO 
former humans. 
 
Veteran medical vaccine whistleblower Dr. Joseph Mercola exposes the “medical reset” 
within Klaus Schwab’s NWO reset. Top international cardiologist, internist and 
epidemiologist Dr. Peter McCullough has been making big waves, in late August 2021 
asserting that the vaccinated carry 251 times the viral load than the non-vaccinated. 
 
Dr. McCullough also promotes natural immunity and benign drugs HCQ and Ivermectin 
instead of the harmful vaccines, just declaring:  “We’re in the middle of a major 
biological catastrophe.” 
 
Even the mRNA and DNA vaccine technology inventor, Dr. Robert Malone, MD rails 
against the Covid-19 mRNA vaccines as biometrically irresponsible and 
highly dangerous:  “We need to confront the data [and] not try to cover stuff up or hide 
risks.” 
 
Canadian Dr. Charles Hoffe was horrified to learn that 62% of his mostly First Nations 
patients experienced permanent blood clot damage after receiving their vaccine. 
 
In this interview, with Laura Lynn Tylor Thompson (also available on  Rumble channel). 
This week the treating physician of national presidents, Dr. Vladimir Zelenko stated in 
an interview: 

https://forbiddenknowledgetv.net/dr-sherri-tenpenny-explains-how-the-depopulation-covid-vaccines-will-start-working-in-3-6-months/
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.net/dr-carrie-madej-covid-shots-dna-and-transhumanism/
https://www.globalresearch.ca/great-reset-accelerating-global-tyranny/5757273
https://www.globalresearch.ca/video-dr-peter-mccullough-therapeutic-nihilism-untested-novel-therapies/5757885?utm_campaign=magnet&utm_source=article_page&utm_medium=related_articles
https://www.globalresearch.ca/study-fully-vaccinated-healthcare-workers-carry-251-times-viral-load-pose-threat-unvaccinated-patients-co-workers/5753908
https://www.lifesitenews.com/news/were-in-the-middle-of-a-major-biological-catastrophe-top-covid-doc-mccullough/
https://stateofthenation.co/?p=85089
https://www.rwmalonemd.com/mrna-vaccine-inventor
https://vaccinefreedom.wordpress.com/2021/07/30/inventor-of-mrna-vaccine-warns-against-the-covid-shot/
https://podcasts.google.com/feed/aHR0cHM6Ly9mZWVkcy5ibHVicnJ5LmNvbS9mZWVkcy9hbWVyaWNhbnRob3VnaHRsZWFkZXJzLnhtbA/episode/aHR0cDovL3d3dy5ibHVicnJ5LmNvbS9hbWVyaWNhbnRob3VnaHRsZWFkZXJzLzgwNjUxMjc3L2RyLXJvYmVydC1tYWxvbmUtbXJuYS12YWNjaW5lLWludmVudG9yLW9uLWxhdGVzdC1jb3ZpZC0xOS1kYXRhLWJvb3N0ZXItc2hvdHMtYW5kLXRoZS1zaGF0dGVyZWQtc2NpZW50aWZpYy1jb25zZW5zdXMtcGFydC0xLw?sa=X&ved=2ahUKEwissf3S5eryAhVSlJ4KHSvyAssQ8qgGegQIARAE
https://citizenfreepress.com/column-1/dr-charles-hoffe-issues-vaccine-warning/
https://www.bitchute.com/video/A6GbcUl6blpJ/
https://rumble.com/vjuhch-canadian-doctor-62-of-patients-vaccinated-for-covid-have-permanent-heart-da.html
https://www.bitchute.com/video/OcOAkV5ViOMT/
https://www.bitchute.com/video/OcOAkV5ViOMT/
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“If we follow the advice of some of the ‘global leaders,’ like Bill Gates said last year, ‘7 
billion people need to be vaccinated,’ then the death rate will be over 2 billion people. 
So wake up! This is World War III.” 
 
Dr. Vladimir Zelenko has been a bit more pointed in his remarks about the Vaxx being 
another Holocaust.  His comments have in an unusual way validated my suggestion that 
Biblical descendants of Abraham, Isaac, and Jacob are the real target for the push to 
vaxx the entire world; and anyone else is collateral damage incurred in exterminating a 
Biblical promise to the Israelites.  By destroying the remnant of Biblical Jews, Lucifer 
can call God a liar for failing to deliver a promise made to the descendants of Abraham! 
 
The cited medical doctors above are but a handful of countless 
heroic physicians who’ve gone public raising their concerns and outrage.  Renowned 
PhD scientists including virologists, immunologists and biochemists have also led the 
way, calling out the Covid-19 plandemic based on the Rockefeller Foundation’s 2010 
Lockstep blueprint. Another Nobel prize winner for inventing the nefariously misused 
PCR test, Dr. Kary Mullis died on the eve of the fake pandemic Wuhan outbreak after 
repeatedly exposing Dr. Frankenstein Fauci. 
 
Patent and intellectual rights expert Dr. David Martin deconstructs the criminal etiology 
of the Covid-19 pandemic while ex-Pfizer VP chief scientist Dr. Michael Yeadon has 
repeatedly delivered his dire warnings: 
 
“The gene-based design makes your body manufacture virus spike protein, and we 
know, and we’ve known for years, that virus spike protein triggers blood 
clots. That’s a fundamental problem.” 
  
Additionally, a growing army of Big Pharma whistleblowers have also courageously 
shed light on this much needed truth of what humanity is perilously facing in the 
coming Dark Winter months when likely millions of democide victims the world over will 
be shockingly laid to rest from fatal blood clots, strokes, heart attacks, multiple organ 
failure, cancer – all directly linked and caused by the Big Pharma non-vaccines. 
 
Idaho board certified pathologist and diagnostics lab owner Dr. Ryan Cole has observed 
an unheard of 20 times increase in endometrial cancers since this year’s vaccine rollout, 
caused by an absence of two types of cells (helper T-cells and CD8 killer T-cells), both 
vital to a functioning immune system. 
 
This notorious pharmaceutical killing machine includes the mRNA spike protein DNA 
altering injections produced by Pfizer and Moderna as well as the Johnson & Johnson, 
UK’s AstraZeneca and China’s Sinovac. 
 
From December 14, 2020 to October 10, 2021 the US government’s own VAERS 
(Vaccine Adverse Events Reporting System) tracking mechanism 
reported 16,000+ vaccine deaths (though a whistleblower claimed over 45,000 within 3 
days from only one of nine districts). 

https://www.globalresearch.ca/57-top-scientists-doctors-release-shocking-study-covid-vaccines-demand-immediate-stop-all-vaccinations/5746848
http://themillenniumreport.com/2020/07/rockefeller-lockstep-2010-was-blueprint-for-2020-covid-19-pandemic/
https://www.globalresearch.ca/kary-b-mullis-no-infection-illness-can-accurately-diagnosed-pcr/5757224?utm_campaign=magnet&utm_source=article_page&utm_medium=related_articles
http://www.davidmartin.world/about/
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.net/dr-david-martin-just-ended-covid-fauci-doj-politicians-in-one-interview/
https://www.globalresearch.ca/video-final-warning-humanity-former-pfizer-chief-scientist-michael-yeadon/5756523
https://stateofthenation.co/?p=78699
https://thenationalpulse.com/news/pfizer-whistleblower-emails-imply-aborted-baby-cells-in-vaccine/
https://vaccinedeaths.com/2021-10-06-hospital-systems-purge-thousands-of-workers-to-engineer-health-care-collapse-dark-winter-die-off.html
https://independentdocsid.com/RyanColeMD
https://www.lifesitenews.com/news/idaho-doctor-reports-a-20-times-increase-of-cancer-in-vaccinated-patients/
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/vaers-cdc-covid-deaths-vaccine-injuries/
https://rightsfreedoms.wordpress.com/2021/07/22/vaers-whistleblower-45000-dead-from-covid-19-vaccines-within-3-days-of-vaccination-sparks-lawsuit-against-federal-government/
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But estimates of less than 1% of adverse injuries and deaths actually do get reported to 
VAERS, so a far more accurate and realistic estimate would be to multiply the reported 
number of deaths by 100, or on the low side, minimally multiply by 10 to account for the 
truer death toll estimate, that would then range from nearly 150,000 deaths. 
 
Combine that with the EU numbers of 25,248 deaths reported over roughly the same 
time period till September 18, 2021, and the numbers jump to over a quarter million. 
Thus, it’s safe to assume that millions around the world have already died as a result of 
Big Pharma kill shots. 
 
And this is just the beginning.  With 81% of September’s supposed Covid-19 deaths in 
the United Kingdom among those determined to have already been vaccinated, the 
evidence of lethal harm caused by the non-vaccines is overwhelming. 
 
In related testimony, Ontario emergency room doctor Rochagné Kilian, who just 
resigned over the local draconian, anti-health Covid-19 protocols, stated recently that 80 
percent of incoming ER patients she treated in the last month suffering from “mysterious 
issues were double vaxxed.” 
 
Running close behind the UK death toll is the 76% of September Covid-19 deaths 
reported in the U.S. state of Vermont that also were fully vaccinated. By diabolical 
design, this burgeoning medical holocaust has rapidly become globalized death by 
injection on a massive, never before seen scale. 
 
Nobel prize winner Dr. Luc Montagnier, who discovered HIV recently submitted 
a sworn affidavit to the International Criminal Court, concluding: 
 
“This [Covid-19] vaccine is the biggest risk to humanity and the biggest risk to genocide 
in the history of humanity.” 
 
Dr. Vladimir Zelenko and Anthony Patch are a few who may have recognized the Covid-
19 Vaxxes for what they really are.  The Virus was made for the Vaccine and the 
Vaxxes are Satan’s plan to exterminate the “Remnant” of God’s “Chosen” people.  I am 
not sure that even Christians can understand what is occurring in the world at the 
present time.  I say that because most of Christianity has become so diluted, fractured, 
and divided by many false teachings and movements like the Seeker-Sensitive church 
and the Emergent Church so as to miss the larger message of the Bible. 
 
Satan has wanted to corrupt God’s creation, not just morally, that is easy to do. He 
wants to corrupt God’s creation physically.  The introduction of mRNA vaccines are 
designed to “change” your DNA.  We are all created in God’s image, hence Satan will 
do that through Vaxxes being offered as “gene” therapy, another word for “gene” editing 
your God-given DNA.  
 
So God created man in His own image, in the image of God created he him; male 
and female created he them.” –(Genesis 1:27) 

https://digital.ahrq.gov/sites/default/files/docs/publication/r18hs017045-lazarus-final-report-2011.pdf
https://theexpose.uk/2021/10/07/81-percent-of-covid-19-deaths-in-september-were-people-who-had-been-vaccinated/
https://www.lifesitenews.com/news/ontario-er-doctor-resigns-over-mandatory-vaccines-and-falsehoods/
https://vermontdailychronicle.com/2021/09/30/76-of-september-covid-19-deaths-are-vaxxed-breakthroughs/
https://theexpose.uk/2021/09/26/holocaust-survivors-dr-fleming-prof-motagnier-icc-genocide-crimes-against-humanity/
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Satan hates this and he and his followers, the fallen angels (demons) have tried to do 
everything to change this. Before the great flood the fallen angels slept with human 
women to corrupt their bloodline, their DNA. This was the beginning of the Nephilim. 
 
“That the sons of God saw the daughters of men that they were fair; and they 
took them wives of all which they chose.”  -(Genesis 6:2) 
 
“There were giants in the earth in those days; and also after that, when the sons 
of God came in unto the daughters of men, and they bare children to them, the 
same became mighty men which were of old, men of renown.”  -(Genesis 6:4) 
 
The fallen angels and Nephilim not only slept with humans but with other species, 
corrupting the whole earth. God saw the corruption and knew that the only way to get rid 
of it was to destroy the earth and everything on it.  If we’re going to be successful in 
battling Satan’s plan for our destruction, we have to be a student of Scripture, and we 
also have to be a student of ourselves to know the weak points in our armor so we can 
take special care to strengthen those areas.   
 
The Apostle Paul In Ephesians 6:12, writes, “For our struggle is not against flesh 
and blood, but against the rulers, against the powers, against the world forces of 
this darkness, against the spiritual forces of wickedness in the heavenly places.” 
Living a God-honoring life is difficult. Paul says it is a struggle. The word “struggle” 
refers to a wrestling match. In Paul’s day a wrestling match was a life-and-death match 
in which the loser would be executed. That’s the kind of struggle Paul said the Christian 
life is.  Unfortunately, the modern-day church has long forgotten what it means to 
struggle against Satan, notwithstanding the fact that most churches do not believe 
Satan exists.   Paul said, “No, our greatest obstacle in life is not another person, 
flesh and blood. It is a spiritual power, Satan himself.” 
 
Notice Ephesians 6:11. Paul says, “Put on the full armor of God, so that you will be 
able to stand firm against the schemes of the devil.” Satan is not only real, but he 
has a scheme to destroy you. Satan has a plan to destroy your marriage. He has a plan 
for the rebellion of your children. He has a plan to ensure your departure from the 
Christian faith. He has a scheme he is working out in your life. It’s very important that 
we not be ignorant of Satan’s schemes.  One of the those schemes revealed in the 
Word of God becomes explicit when one reads it in a continual way, it does not stand 
out when you read it devotionally or even topically. 
  
“What is the cause of all the anti-Semitism in the world?” 
 
The Christian web site “Got Questions.com” offers this answer: 
 
Answer: Why does the world hate the Jews? Why is anti-Semitism so rampant in so 
many different nations? What is so bad about the Jews? History has shown that at 
various times over the last 1,700 years the Jews have been expelled from over 80 
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different countries. Historians and experts have concluded there are at least six possible 
reasons: 
 
• Racial Theory – the Jews are hated because they are an inferior race. 
 
• Economic Theory – the Jews are hated because they possess too much wealth and 
power. 
 
• Outsiders Theory – the Jews are hated because they are different from everyone else. 
 
• Scapegoat Theory – the Jews are hated because they are the cause for all the world’s 
problems. 
 
• Deicide Theory – the Jews are hated because they killed Jesus Christ. 
 
• Chosen People Theory – the Jews are hated because they arrogantly declare they are 
the “chosen ones of God.” 
 
Is there any substance to these theories? 
 
• With respect to the racial theory, the truth is that the Jews are not a race. Anyone in 
the world of any color, creed or race can become a Jew. 
 
• The economic theory citing that the Jews are wealthy doesn’t hold much weight. 
History has shown that during the 17th through the 20th centuries, especially in Poland 
and Russia, the Jews were desperately poor and had very little, if any, influence in 
business or political systems. 
 
• As for the outsiders’ theory, during the 18th century, the Jews desperately tried to 
assimilate with the rest of Europe. They had hoped that assimilation would cause anti-
Semitism to disappear. However, they were hated even more by those who claimed the 
Jews would infect their race with inferior genes. This was especially true in Germany 
prior to World War II. 
 
• As for the scapegoat theory, the fact is that the Jews have always been hated, which 
makes them a very convenient target. 
 
• As for the idea of deicide, the Bible makes it clear that the Romans were the ones who 
actually killed Jesus, though the Jews acted as accomplices. It wasn’t until a few 
hundred years later that the Jews were cited as the murderers of Jesus. One wonders 
why the Romans are not the ones hated. Jesus Himself forgave the Jews -(Luke 23:34). 
Even the Vatican absolved the Jews of Jesus’ death in 1963. Nevertheless, neither 
statement has diminished anti-Semitism.  The RCC absolution undoubtedly came years 
too late to have made much of a difference. 
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• As for their claim to being the “chosen people of God,” the Jews in Germany rejected 
their “chosen-ness” status during the latter part of the 19th century to better assimilate 
into German culture. Nevertheless, they suffered the Holocaust. Today, some Christians 
and Muslims claim to be the “chosen people” of God, yet for the most part, the world 
tolerates them and still hates the Jews. 
 
This brings us to the real reason why the world hates the Jews. The apostle Paul tells 
us, “For I could wish that I myself were cursed and cut off from Christ for the sake 
of my brothers, those of my own race, the people of Israel. Theirs is the adoption 
as sons; theirs the divine glory, the covenants, the receiving of the law, the 
temple worship and the promises. Theirs are the patriarchs, and from them is 
traced the human ancestry of Christ, who is God over all, forever praised!” -
(Romans 9:3-5). 
 
The truth is that the world hates the Jews because the world hates God. The Jews were 
God’s firstborn, His chosen people -(Deuteronomy 14:2). Through the Jewish 
patriarchs, the prophets, and the temple, God used the Jews to bring forth His Word, 
the Law, and morality to a world of sin. He sent forth His son, Jesus the Christ, in a 
Jewish body to redeem the world of sin. Satan, the prince of the earth -(John 14:30; 
Ephesians 2:2), has poisoned the minds of men with his hated of the Jews.  The 
Revelation 12 prophecy for an allegorical depiction of Satan’s (the dragon’s) hatred of 
the Jewish nation (the woman). 
 
Satan has tried to wipe out the Jews through the Babylonians, the Persians, the 
Assyrians, the Egyptians, the Hittites, and the Nazis. But he’s failed every time. God is 
not finished with Israel. Romans 11:26 tells us that someday all Israel will be saved, and 
this cannot come to pass if Israel no longer exists. Therefore, God will preserve the 
Jews for the future, just as He has preserved their remnant throughout history, until His 
final plan comes to pass. Nothing can thwart God’s plan for Israel and the Jewish 
people.  
 
Isn’t it amazing that through all the centuries, the persecution, the slaughter and rabid 
hatred of the Jews, yet they are still a people? Not only that, but God brought his people 
back to their land – Israel! It was prophesied in the Bible. He would bring back the 
Jewish people from the four corners of the earth – back to their own land in Israel.  
Read Isaiah 66:8.   
 
It has really been Satan all along! The father of lies, the author of confusion, and the 
accuser of the brethren hates the Jewish people, because he knows that through their 
lineage, the Messiah of the World would come! He actually thought that he could thwart 
God’s plan of Salvation by killing off the people from whom He would come.  As I have 
been writing this article, It is my belief that we are seeing Satan’s last hurrah culminating 
in our time. Satan knows his time is limited.  For those who still believe in the Pre-
Tribulation Rapture, we have ample evidence for holding that belief!  That may seem 
like a bitter pill to swallow but I believe it will get worse, before deliverance comes.  
Because of the hatred that Satan has poured into the hearts of unbelieving men and 
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women for Israel, the whole world now stands against her. The P5+1 Nuclear 
agreement with Iran was the world slapping Israel directly in the face, and saying loudly 
that their hope is for her total annihilation.  This hatred became like a cancer when 
Satan convinced the Khazarian empire to convert to Judaism.  It wormed its way deep 
inside the Hebrew nation sewing hatred for the Biblical descendants of Abraham, Isaac, 
and Jacob.  Jesus brought this to the world’s attention in Revelation 2:9 and 3:9, both 
as a prophecy and as a warning for those who would be facing what we have been part 
of since early 2020.   
 
When you think about it, it’s a bold move, really, to lay out the whole game plan before 
men and devils, declaring the outcome of the war even before the final battle begins. 
God’s confidence should enhance our own. Though Lucifer may rage and seek to 
destroy, he continually gets blindsided by the small and simple means God uses to 
defeat him again and again. The ultimate triumph is a given. The remaining question is 
whether we will stand or fall in the fight. And that hinges on our treatment of God’s 
Word. 
 
FROM NBC NEWS on Thursday, October 14th: The Biden administration has 
purchased 65 million pediatric doses of the Pfizer/BioNTech vaccine, enough to 
vaccinate (poison) the estimated 28 million children who would be eligible should the 
Food and Drug Administration approve Pfizer's request to vaccinate children ages 5 to 
11, said an official of the Department of Health and Human Services. 
 
Pfizer and BioNTech said this month that they had submitted an emergency request for 
authorization for children ages 5 to 11, and an FDA advisory committee plans to meet to 
discuss the request on October 26. The vaccine doses for the youngest age group 
wouldn't be interchangeable with those for adults, who have different dosage and 
dilution requirements.  Recall what I said on page 18 about the meaning of the name 
“Pfizer”?  It was Benjamin Netanyahu who contracted with Pfizer to vaxx the Jewish 
people of Israel.  They are now faced with mandated “booster” kill shots, despite being 
fully vaxxed.   
 
What demonic psychopath would call for the vaxx of children which has a survival rate 
of: 
 
 Age         Covid Survival Rate  
 0-19       99.9973%  
 20-29     99.986%  
 30-39     99.969%  
 40-49     99.918%  
 50-59     99.73%  
 60-69     99.41%  
 70+        97.6% (non-institutionalized.)  
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Timeless Truth in Humor! 
 
In the Book of Job, we saw that Job was tested for a time, however when it was all over, 
God rewarded him. God set things right.  Scripture says Job was rewarded double for 
his losses.   
 
In the last days, we are finding that God's people will also be tested for a time, but when 
Satan steps over the threshold line and sits down as God, then all evil will be brought to 
an end. It is at that time that the signs of God's wrath will be given without mercy. The 
plagues will be poured on the earth and God's people will be delivered.  Two factors 
stand out as signs and seem to be converging here in God’s seething anger that is 
building: approving child vaxxes, and the rising death rate among the Jewish nation and 
the Jewish people world-wide.   
 
The final prerequisite to a one-world government is the Rapture of the church.  “And 
now you know what is holding him back, so that he may be revealed at the proper 
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time” -(2nd Thessalonians 2:6).  Jesus predicted in the last days, “many will depart 
from the faith” and “because of the increase of wickedness the love of most will 
grow cold.”  Paul warned the time would come when preachers will not put up with 
sound doctrine but will just say what itching ears want to hear. 
 
Early efforts at re-gathering the church following the pandemic shutdown have not been 
encouraging. It’s estimated an average of only 33% have returned to worship.  In the 
last days, the church will be so weakened by compromise that most members won’t be 
able to distinguish between God’s truth and Satan’s lies.  They will endorse Satan’s 
irreligious agenda and get sucked into the lie that humans can save themselves through 
international cooperation and social engineering.  Parents will sacrifice their minor 
children in the name of safety, believing the lie of Satan and his minions that one can be 
saved with a vaccine.  History never bode well for societies that sacrificed their young 
on the altar of Baal! 
 
In the end, the small remnant of believers who would offer strong resistance to the 
antichrist will be abruptly Raptured by Christ and taken out of the world.  “For the 
secret power of lawlessness is already at work, but the one who now holds it 
back will continue to do so until He is taken out of the way.  And then the lawless 
one will be revealed” -(2nd Thessalonians 2:7-8).  When the Holy Spirit, living in the 
hearts of believers, is taken out of the world, the strongest resistance to Satan’s scheme 
will be removed, and the way paved for him take control. 
 
I have discussed the “Remnant” of Israel several times in the past, and you should 
recognize that it is an undeclared doctrine of the Scriptures.   One of the best overview 
of this theme found in the Scriptures was by one of the greatest Bible scholars of 
modern time, Dr. Tom McCall.  I have shared his study for those with ears to hear and 
eyes to see before. 
 
Why does Satan believe that he must destroy Israel from off the face of the earth? For 
thousands of years Satan has demonstrated an insane and insatiable drive to wipe out 
the Jewish people, but so far has not been able to fully accomplish his goal. Let’s review 
some of his major attempts: 
 

 When Abraham went to Egypt and lied about Sarah, nearly causing Pharaoh to 
violate her. 

 When Abraham had Ishmael with Hagar, bypassing Sarah. 

 When Ishmael ridiculed Isaac, attempting to usurp Isaac’s position. 

 When Esau attempted to gain Jacob’s blessing from Isaac. 

 When Pharaoh ordered all male Hebrew infants to be murdered. 

 When Pharaoh attempted to destroy Israel backed up against the Red Sea. 

 When Israel decided to worship the Golden Calf at Mt. Sinai. 

 When Israel decided to stay in the wilderness rather than go into Canaan. 

 When Moab tried to destroy Israel and stop them from entering Canaan. 

 When the Canaanites amassed all their armies to destroy the invading Israelites. 
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 When the surrounding nations tried to destroy Israel during the time of the 
Judges. 

 When the surrounding nations tried to destroy Israel during the time of the kings. 

 When the Assyrian army destroyed Israel and much of Judah. 

 When the Babylonian army destroyed the Temple and Jerusalem. 

 When the refugees from Babylon and Persia were restoring the Temple and 
Jerusalem 

 When Haman attempted to destroy all the Jews throughout the Persian Empire.  

 When the Greco-Syrian forces tried to Hellenize Judea under Antiochus 
Epiphanes 

 When the Roman army destroyed Judea and Jerusalem twice (70 AD and 135 
AD) 

 When the Jewish people were scattered and persecuted throughout the world for 
2,000 years. 

 When Hitler organized the Holocaust and destroyed over Six million Jews. 

 When the Jews attempted to return to Israel against extensive international 
opposition. 

 When Israel declared its independence in 1947 and was invaded by Egypt, 
Jordan, and Syria. 

 When Israel was invaded in 1967 and 1973 by its surrounding neighbors 

 When Israel was disrupted by numerous intifadas from Palestinians and 
Jihadists. 

 When Hamas hurled thousands of rockets from Gaza into Israel in 2014. 
 
So we see, for 4,000 years the Jewish people have faced relentless persecution, 
opposition and attempts to annihilate and destroy them. If it were any of other people, it 
would seem totally irrational and insane. However, with Israel, there appears to be a 
certain rational, though Satanic, strategy behind this animosity. 
 
For Satan, the destruction of Israel is a matter of self-preservation. Ultimately, the 
survival of Israel results in the eternal perdition of Satan. How can this be? Because 
when Israel repents and nationally invites the Lord Jesus Christ to be their own 
Redeemer/Messiah, that generation of Israel will be saved, and Satan’s plan to destroy 
the Jews will be finally defeated. Christ will return to the earth, destroy the Satanic 
Antichrist and his armies at Armageddon, establish His Kingdom over Israel and the 
world for 1,000 years, and then cast Satan into the Lake of Fire forever and ever. 
 
The key is that Israel must survive to receive Christ nationally as their own true 
Messiah.  As Jesus said when He lamented over Jerusalem from the Mount of Olives a 
few days before He died and rose from the dead at His First Coming: 
 

39“For I say to you, from now on you shall not see Me until you say, ‘Blessed is He 
who comes in the name of the Lord!'”  -(Matthew 23:39-24:1), 
 
While the remnant of Israel in every generation would receive Him all during the long 
period between His First and Second Comings (the Church Age), the nation Israel will 
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not receive Him until after the Rapture of the Church and the Seven Year Tribulation. 
Thus, when Israel receives Jesus Christ, this will usher in the events that spell the doom 
of Satan. 
 
From Satan’s point of view, he must keep Israel from surviving to the point in time when 
they will be ready to receive Jesus as their long awaited Messiah/Redeemer. They had 
a great opportunity to receive Him at His First Coming, but as John states: 
 
11“He came to His own, and those who were His own did not receive Him. 12But as 
many as received Him, to them He gave the right to become children of God, even 
to those who believe in His name.”  -(John 1:11-12). 
 
Israel did not recognize its great “hour of visitation” when Jesus came the first time, 
but when He comes again, the nation of Israel as a whole that survives the Tribulation 
will at last be ready, willing and eager to receive Him as Savior and Lord.  Those who 
survive will be the last “Remnant” of the original blood-line of Abraham, Isaac, and 
Jacob. 
 
Thus Satan has strived mightily to destroy Israel through the centuries up until this 
present time so that there would be no Israel to invite Jesus to return to the earth. Why 
hasn’t Satan been able to accomplish his repeated purpose to kill off this small nation of 
only a few million people? It is because God has promised to preserve His covenant 
nation forever, as Jeremiah so eloquently explains: 
 
35“Thus says the LORD, Who gives the sun for light by day, And the fixed order of 
the moon and the stars for light by night, Who stirs up the sea so that its waves 
roar; The LORD of hosts is His name: 36If this fixed order departs From before 
Me,” declares the LORD, Then the offspring of Israel also shall cease From being 
a nation before Me forever.”  -(Jeremiah 31:35-36).   
 
God here states what it would take to destroy Israel. One would have to first destroy the 
sun, moon and stars. Once that had been accomplished then, and only then, could 
someone go about destroying Israel. This future prophecy draws closer each day. The 
last time I looked, the Sun, Moon and stars were still functioning, so that must mean 
Israel has not ceased being a nation. 
 
Satan wants to destroy Israel so that he can keep God from sending him into eternal 
perdition, but God will not allow Satan to destroy His Chosen Nation. Israel is the apple 
of God’s eye, so it must survive as a nation before Him for all time. 
 
The devotional site “Grace Through Faith” noted this:  
 
“Satan tried to prevent Jesus from coming to the earth by contaminating the human 
genome. One of the reasons for the Flood was to wipe out the hybrid-humans produced 
by the fallen angels mating with human women. Noah and his family were the only 
genetically uncontaminated humans. Through Herod’s decree to kill all male boys 2 and 
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younger, Satan tried to destroy Jesus again but failed. Now that Jesus has won for 
mankind the chance for eternal life and Satan has been defeated, why is Satan still 
trying to destroy the Jews via the Holocaust and now through another oncoming 
Mideast war? It can’t just be a supernatural hissy fit. Satan must see a way to avoid his 
ultimate destruction if he can kill the Jews.” 
 
In Hosea 5:15 there’s a prophecy of the Lord’s return to heaven after being rejected by 
Israel. It says. 
 
“Then I will go back to my place until they admit their guilt. And they will seek my 
face, in their misery they will earnestly seek me.” 
 
A few days before His crucifixion Jesus said, “Look, your house is left to you 
desolate. For I tell you, you will not see me again until you say, ‘Blessed is He 
who comes in the name of the Lord’” -(Matthew 23:39). 
 
Scholars have interpreted these verses to mean that Jesus will not return to Earth until 
Israel officially petitions Him to do so. They speculate that Satan believes if he can wipe 
out Israel before that happens he can prevent the Lord’s return.  I ask you, is this not 
what is happening again:  Satan is still trying to prevent Jesus from coming to the earth 
by contaminating the human genome, this time with the poison syringe needle using 
DNA changing toxins?  As Anthony Patch puts it bluntly, to take the Vaxx is to identify 
you with the kingdom of Satan and that has eternal implications! 
 
This may be why we’re seeing such a rapid increase in the frequency and intensity of 
anti-Semitism in the world today. If so, it’s another sign that the end is near. 
 
Blessings, 
 
 
Pastor Bob, EvanTeachr@aol.com 
www.pastorbobreid.com  
http://jesusisthewaythetruththelife.com/node/22  
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