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Mass Murder 

By Sovereign State Sanctioned Syringe Needle! 
Part 66 

 
 

Pfizer appears to have committed fraud, and if it can be proven in 
court then the company will be liable for ALL injuries and deaths 
caused by its covid vaccines 
05/13/2022 / By Ethan Huff  
 

 
 
The so-called “clinical trials” that Pfizer conducted on its messenger RNA 
(mRNA) Wuhan coronavirus (Covid-19) “vaccine” appear to have been completely 
fraudulent, which means the company could one day be held liable for all 
associated injuries and deaths. 
 
Documents released in November 2021 by the U.S. Food and Drug Administration 
(FDA) as part of a court-mandated information dump reveal that enrollment at one 
particular trial site happened at warp speed, just in time to meet the safety 
deadline for the FDA’s VRBPAC meeting on Dec. 10, 2020. 
 
This meeting is where the FDA discussed granting Emergency Use Authorization 
(EUA) for the Pfizer-BioNTech injection in people 16 years of age and older. 

https://www.newstarget.com/author/ethanh
https://uncoverdc.com/2022/05/12/the-pfizer-clinical-trial-is-there-evidence-of-fraud/
https://uncoverdc.com/2022/05/12/the-pfizer-clinical-trial-is-there-evidence-of-fraud/
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(Related: The contents of the Pfizer jab were recently shown to “stick” to bodily 
organs.) 
 
“The allegedly suspicious-looking clinical trial data surrounds ‘the biggest 
recruiter by far,’ site 1231 (site 4444 was assigned site id 1231) in Argentina,” 
reported Undercover DC. 
 
“Adding to the confusion, in five short days before the safety deadline (including 
a Sunday, 9/27/20), the trial recruited 1,275 of the 4,501 people using site number 
4444. In just three weeks, the site recruited 4,501 patients – 10% of the entire trial 
at one site.” 
 
“Overall, Pfizer rapidly recruited roughly 44,000 people for their trial, which took 
place at 152 locations worldwide and was overseen by numerous investigators, 
including Dr. Fernando Polack, who led the Argentinian study at Hospital Militar 
Central.” 
 
Does Pfizer do ANYTHING honestly and above board? 
 
Polack, as explained by investigative reporter Steve Kirsch, holds the position of 
Scientific Director at the INFANT Foundation in Buenos Aires. This Vanderbilt-
affiliated foundation facilitates biomedical translational research and pediatric 
rotations at hospitals and medical centers throughout the city. 
 
Polack personally coordinates 26 hospitals in Argentina involving 467 doctors 
who were all immediately recruited into the Pfizer trial. Kirsch says that on paper, 
the data that resulted “looks too good to be true,” though he says “it’s quite 
possible they pulled it off” by coordinating the trial in record time. 
 
“So if all 26 hospitals participated fully then that’s 57 patients per week per 
hospital which is possible if the sites have done this before and have a 
coordination framework for getting all 26 sites up and running at the same time,” 
Kirsch writes. “This means that everyone who was doing something else dropped 
what they were doing to switch over to the trial all at the same time.” 
 
Prof. Norman Fenton from Queen Mary University of London added in his own 
two-part Substack series that what was supposedly pulled off in Argentina on 
behalf of Pfizer is “basically impossible.” 
 
“If this really happened,” he wrote, “it would be a wonder of the world, and they 
should publish the process with pride and win 27 different prizes for it.” 
 
“They claim to have enrolled seven days a week for three weeks with zero gaps. 
Each patient requires a 250-page case report form,” Fenton added. “The lead 
investigator seems to have been Fernando Polack.” 
 

https://naturalnews.com/2022-05-10-lipid-nanoparticles-covid-jabs-stick-bodily-organs.html
https://www.qmul.ac.uk/
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“If indeed, the best way to get things done is to give them to busy people, then 
this was a great choice because, from the look of things, Fernando is one busy 
fellah and connected up the wazoo to boot. He also works with Vanderbilt, the 
FDA, and the Infant Foundation, funded by the Gates Foundation and the NIH.” 
 
In the disclosure forms associated with a ‘New England Journal of 
Medicine’ (NEJM) paper on Pfizer’s injection, Polack’s conflicts of interest are 
revealed. They show personal fees he accepted from not only Pfizer but also 
Janssen (Johnson & Johnson), Regeneron (monoclonal antibodies), Merck & Co. 
and Novavax. 
 
Should any of this make it to court, Pfizer will be in a whole lot of trouble – and 
rightfully so. Perhaps justice will eventually prevail. 
 
 

FDA Authorizes Pfizer Booster for Kids 5 to 11, Bypasses Advisory 
Panel 
The U.S. Food and Drug Administration today granted Emergency Use 
Authorization for Pfizer’s COVID-19 booster for children ages 5 to 11, without 
convening its vaccine advisory panel and despite the latest data showing higher 
case rates in vaccinated children compared with those not vaccinated. 
By Megan Redshaw 
 
The U.S. Food and Drug Administration (FDA) today authorized a booster dose of 
the Pfizer-BioNTech COVID-19 vaccine for children ages 5 to 11, without 
convening its vaccine advisory panel of independent experts to discuss Pfizer’s 
data on 5- to 11-year-olds — and based on a study subset of only 67 
children, CNBC reported. 
 
The FDA granted Emergency Use Authorization (EUA) for the boosters despite 
data showing higher infection rates among fully vaccinated children in the 5 to 11 
age group compared to unvaccinated children, no studies testing the efficacy of 
the vaccine against the current dominant BA.2 COVID-19 variant and two new 
studies showing that for vaccinated people who get Omicron, the infection 
provides better protection against future infections than a second booster dose. 
The vaccine advisory panel for the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention 
(CDC) is scheduled to meet Thursday. The agency and its director, Dr. Rochelle 
Walensky, are expected to sign off on the boosters, The Washington Post 
reported. 
 
Dr. Peter Marks, director of the FDA’s Center for Biologics Evaluation and 
Research, said data increasingly show protection provided by two shots wanes 
over time, but the agency determined a third shot could help boost protection for 
children in the 5 to 11 age group and the “benefits outweigh the risks.” 

https://childrenshealthdefense.org/authors/megan-redshaw/
https://www.cnbc.com/2022/05/17/fda-authorizes-pfizer-covid-booster-dose-for-kids-ages-5-to-11-years-old.html
https://www.theepochtimes.com/people-who-pushed-idea-of-universal-vaccination-are-guilty-of-crimes-against-humanity-former-pfizer-vp_4462787.html?utm_source=News&utm_campaign=breaking-2022-05-15-2&utm_medium=email&est=yrQTpecG72ykIhaf3M8zP%2BFCzcWpxvgOi1QtNxrUCV8saFBrDEDVS4TkzpuRg3%2BU%2F5V%2F
https://www.cnbc.com/2022/05/17/fda-authorizes-pfizer-covid-booster-dose-for-kids-ages-5-to-11-years-old.html
https://www.cnbc.com/2022/05/17/fda-authorizes-pfizer-covid-booster-dose-for-kids-ages-5-to-11-years-old.html
https://www.webmd.com/lung/news/20220329/stealth-omicron-now-dominant-covid-variant-in-u-s#:~:text=The%20so%2Dcalled%20stealth%20Omicron,for%20Disease%20Control%20and%20Prevention.&text=Also%20known%20as%20BA.,the%20week%20ending%20March%2026.
https://fortune.com/2022/05/16/omicron-infection-covid-protects-better-than-booster/
https://fortune.com/2022/05/16/omicron-infection-covid-protects-better-than-booster/
https://www.washingtonpost.com/health/2022/05/16/fda-pfizer-booster-kids/
https://www.washingtonpost.com/health/2022/05/16/fda-pfizer-booster-kids/
https://www.cnbc.com/2022/05/17/fda-authorizes-pfizer-covid-booster-dose-for-kids-ages-5-to-11-years-old.html
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-booster-covid-vaccine-wane/
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-booster-covid-vaccine-wane/
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The FDA authorized the third shot after analyzing data from an ongoing Pfizer 
clinical trial in which a small subset of only 67 children in the age group had 
higher antibody levels one month after receiving a booster dose. 
 
As The Defender reported, antibody levels alone are not indicative of immune 
protection. When it comes to COVID-19, T cell and natural killer cell responses 
are the crucial part of immune protection. 
 
Pfizer has not published its actual data, precluding experts from conducting this 
analysis. 
 
The authorized booster dose, the same strength as the first two doses, generated 
neutralizing antibodies to Omicron and the ancestral Wuhan version of the 
virus, according to The New York Times. 
 
The FDA said it did not identify any new safety concerns and found the children 
in the trial experienced the same mild side effects other people do after receiving 
a booster. 
 
However, a subset of only 67 children is not large enough to detect potential 
adverse events like myocarditis, and it is unknown how rapidly any protection 
provided wanes because trial participants were not followed beyond a 28-day 
period. 
 
About 8.1 million, or 28%, of children ages 5 to 11, received their primary series of 
two COVID-19 vaccine doses as of May 11, according to data from the American 
Academy of Pediatrics. 
 
Those children will now be eligible for a third dose five months after their second 
dose based on data obtained from the 67 children who were followed for only one 
month. 
 
COVID cases higher in vaccinated children aged 5 to 11, CDC data show. 
 
According to the latest CDC data, since February, higher COVID-19 case rates 
were recorded among fully vaccinated children compared to unvaccinated 
children in the 5 to 11 age group. 
 
The CDC on Feb. 12 reported a weekly case rate of 250.02 per 10,000 population 
in fully vaccinated children ages 5 to 11, compared to 245.82 for unvaccinated 
children in the same age group. 
 
The trend continued through the third week of March, which is the latest week of 
available data. 
 

https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-covid-vaccine-5-to-11-year-olds-fda-emergency-use-authorization/
https://www.pfizer.com/news/press-release/press-release-detail/pfizer-and-biontech-granted-us-emergency-use-authorization
https://www.nytimes.com/2022/05/17/us/politics/fda-pfizer-booster-children.html
https://www.cnbc.com/2022/05/17/fda-authorizes-pfizer-covid-booster-dose-for-kids-ages-5-to-11-years-old.html
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/deaths-covid-vaccines-vaers-cdc-data/
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC4916819/#:~:text=The%20sample%20size%20is%20one%20of%20the%20first%20practical%20steps,groups%2C%20making%20the%20study%20unethical.
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/vaers-cdc-child-vaccine-induced-myocarditis-deaths-injuries/
https://www.aap.org/en/pages/2019-novel-coronavirus-covid-19-infections/children-and-covid-19-vaccination-trends/
https://www.aap.org/en/pages/2019-novel-coronavirus-covid-19-infections/children-and-covid-19-vaccination-trends/
https://www.cnbc.com/2022/05/17/fda-authorizes-pfizer-covid-booster-dose-for-kids-ages-5-to-11-years-old.html
https://covid.cdc.gov/covid-data-tracker/#rates-by-vaccine-status
https://covid.cdc.gov/covid-data-tracker/#rates-by-vaccine-status


5 
 

“Several factors likely affect crude case rates by vaccination and booster dose 
status, making interpretation of recent trends difficult,” CDC spokesperson 
Jasmine Reed told The Epoch Times in an email. 
 
“Limitations include higher prevalence of previous infection among the 
unvaccinated and unboosted groups, difficulty in accounting for time since 
vaccination and waning protection, and possible differences in testing practices 
(such as at-home tests) and prevention behaviors by age and vaccination status,” 
Reed said. “These limitations appear to have less impact on the death rates 
presented here.” 
 
According to CDC data, the gap between fully vaccinated and unvaccinated 
individuals in all age groups has grown increasingly smaller, with the death rate 
showing the same trend for people over age 50. 
 
For people under age 50, death rates are almost identical between the vaccinated 
and unvaccinated since the beginning of the vaccine rollout. 
 
Data show COVID-19 vaccines have a “negligible effect” on people, said Dr. Peter 
McCullough, a prominent cardiologist and epidemiologist. 
 
“With these results in hand, it is clear the vaccines are having a negligible effect 
in populations,” McCullough told The Epoch Times in an email. 
 
“Given the overall poor safety profile and lack of any assurances on long-term 
safety, Americans should be cautious in considering additional injections of 
these products.” 
 
Having COVID may be more effective than getting a booster, studies show. 
 
Two new studies show, for people who are vaccinated against COVID-19, getting 
a breakthrough Omicron infection may provide better protection than receiving a 
second booster, Fortune reported. 
 
One study conducted by German biotechnology company BioNTech SE assessed 
vaccinated individuals who had breakthrough COVID-19 infection associated with 
the Omicron variant. 
 
BioNTech found these individuals had a better B-cell response than individuals 
who had received a booster but had not been infected. 
 
According to MD Anderson Center, B cells are a type of white blood cell that 
creates antibodies that bind to pathogens or foreign substances and neutralize 
them. B cells bind to a virus and prevent it from entering a normal cell causing 
infection. They also recruit other cells to help destroy infected cells. 
 

https://www.theepochtimes.com/higher-covid-19-infection-rates-among-vaccinated-children-than-unvaccinated-cdc-data-show_4470005.html?utm_source=News&utm_campaign=breaking-2022-05-17-1&utm_medium=email&est=FL%2BawmlPbl2h9%2Fc6q80RBg8qh%2BDnX%2Bim0p9OWuarv2ZoVYnIe%2BoUNFQ1iN1D8nw%2Bz38i
https://covid.cdc.gov/covid-data-tracker/#rates-by-vaccine-status
https://www.theepochtimes.com/higher-covid-19-infection-rates-among-vaccinated-children-than-unvaccinated-cdc-data-show_4470005.html?utm_source=News&utm_campaign=breaking-2022-05-17-1&utm_medium=email&est=FL%2BawmlPbl2h9%2Fc6q80RBg8qh%2BDnX%2Bim0p9OWuarv2ZoVYnIe%2BoUNFQ1iN1D8nw%2Bz38i
https://www.theepochtimes.com/higher-covid-19-infection-rates-among-vaccinated-children-than-unvaccinated-cdc-data-show_4470005.html?utm_source=News&utm_campaign=breaking-2022-05-17-1&utm_medium=email&est=FL%2BawmlPbl2h9%2Fc6q80RBg8qh%2BDnX%2Bim0p9OWuarv2ZoVYnIe%2BoUNFQ1iN1D8nw%2Bz38i
https://fortune.com/2022/05/16/omicron-infection-covid-protects-better-than-booster/
https://fortune.com/2022/05/16/omicron-infection-covid-protects-better-than-booster/
https://fortune.com/2022/05/16/omicron-infection-covid-protects-better-than-booster/
https://www.mdanderson.org/cancerwise/t-cells--b-cells-and-the-immune-system.h00-159465579.html
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A second study by the University of Washington and Vir Biotechnology 
investigated the immune responses of various groups based on vaccination and 
infection status. 
 
The study analyzed blood samples of individuals who had been vaccinated and 
then caught the Delta or Omicron variants and compared them with those who 
had COVID-19 first and were then vaccinated, those who had been vaccinated but 
were not previously infected and those who were infected but had never received 
a COVID-19 vaccine. 
 
The study found vaccinated individuals with breakthrough Omicron infection 
produced antibodies that formed a strong defense against other variants of the 
virus. Unvaccinated people who caught Omicron did not have a similarly robust 
immune response. 
 
Efficacy of Pfizer’s COVID vaccine wanes rapidly. 
 
A study published May 13 in the Journal of the American Medical Association 
(JAMA) found protection from Pfizer’s COVID-19 vaccine turned negatively 
effective among children and adolescents five months after receiving a second 
dose — meaning recipients were more likely to get COVID-19 five months after 
being vaccinated. 
 
Vaccine effectiveness “was no longer significantly different from 0 during month 
3 after the second dose,” the researchers wrote. They also found protection 
against hospitalization waned significantly over time. 
 
In adolescents, the authors said, efficacy increased again with boosters. 
 
Most non-randomized studies attempting to determine vaccine efficacy (VE) had 
“common flaws,” including no accounting for baseline prior COVID-19 infection, 
no reporting for those who received a booster within a six-month time window 
and no adjudication of hospitalization or death due to COVID-19 or other 
conditions, McCullough told The Epoch Times. 
 
“As a result, most studies of COVID-19 VE have biases towards overestimating 
any clinical benefit of vaccination,” McCullough said. 
 
As The Defender reported on May 13, a different study published in JAMA 
showed second and third doses of Pfizer’s COVID-19 vaccine provided protection 
against the Omicron variant for only a few weeks. 
 
“Our study found a rapid decline in Omicron-specific serum neutralizing antibody 
titers only a few weeks after the second and third doses of [the Pfizer-BioNTech] 
BNT162b2,” the authors wrote. 
 

https://fortune.com/2022/05/16/omicron-infection-covid-protects-better-than-booster/
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2792524
https://www.theepochtimes.com/higher-covid-19-infection-rates-among-vaccinated-children-than-unvaccinated-cdc-data-show_4470005.html?utm_source=News&utm_campaign=breaking-2022-05-17-1&utm_medium=email&est=FL%2BawmlPbl2h9%2Fc6q80RBg8qh%2BDnX%2Bim0p9OWuarv2ZoVYnIe%2BoUNFQ1iN1D8nw%2Bz38i
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-booster-covid-vaccine-wane/
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A preprint study released in February showed Pfizer’s two-dose regimen of its 
COVID-19 vaccine for children was only 12% effective against Omicron in children 
ages 9 to 11, and the effectiveness of the vaccine “declined rapidly” for children 5 
to 11. 
 
Researchers at the New York State Department of Health and the University at 
Albany School of Public Health examined the effectiveness of the vaccine in 
children 5 to 11 and adolescents 12 to 17 from Dec. 13, 2021, to Jan. 30, 2022, and 
determined the effectiveness of Pfizer’s COVID-19 vaccine declined rapidly for 
children, particularly those 5-11 years. 
 
According to a Danish study of 128 people who had received two or three doses 
of Pfizer’s COVID-19 vaccine, levels of Omicron-specific “neutralizing” antibodies 
decline rapidly after a second and third dose of Pfizer’s shot. 
 
Compared to original and Delta variants, researchers found the proportion of 
Omicron-specific antibodies detected in participants’ blood dropped “rapidly” 
from 76% four weeks after the second dose to 53% at weeks 8 to 10 and 19% at 
weeks 12 to 14. 
 
After the third shot, neutralizing antibodies against Omicron fell 5.4-fold between 
week 3 and week 8. 
 
Last month, Moderna requested EUA for its COVID-19 vaccine for children aged 6 
months to 6 years. Pfizer plans to seek EUA for a three-dose regimen for the 
same age group. 
 
The FDA’s top vaccine official told a congressional committee on May 6 COVID-19 
vaccines for children under 6 will not have to meet the agency’s 50% efficacy 
threshold required to obtain EUA.   
 
This is totally irresponsible for a government agency tasked with public health 
and safety.  IT IS A DERLICTION OF GOVERNMENT TASKED RESPONSIBILITY!    
 

IMPORTANT ARTICLES YOU NEED TO BE AWARE OF FROM 
AROUND THE WORLD  

vvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvvv 

  
WHO Pandemic Treaty: What It Is, Why It Matters and How to Stop It 
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pandemic-treaty-world-health-
organization-cola/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=cf719764-03e4-4011-9605-
d16b110d2c43 
  
Military Throwing Cash at Recruiting Crisis as Troops Head for the Exits 
https://www.military.com/daily-news/2022/05/13/bigger-bonuses-pentagons-top-
weapon-combat-recruiting-crisis-troops-head-exits.html 

https://www.medrxiv.org/content/10.1101/2022.02.25.22271454v1.full.pdf
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-vaccine-only-12-percent-effective-kids-5-to-11/
https://www.forbes.com/sites/roberthart/2022/05/13/pfizers-covid-vaccine-protection-against-omicron-fades-just-weeks-after-second-and-third-doses-study-finds/?sh=a4236832af3f
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-booster-covid-vaccine-wane/
https://www.fda.gov/emergency-preparedness-and-response/mcm-legal-regulatory-and-policy-framework/emergency-use-authorization
https://endpts.com/fdas-peter-marks-to-congress-youngest-kids-vaccine-wont-need-to-hit-50-efficacy-mark/
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/covid-vaccines-kids-efficacy-standard-fda/
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/covid-vaccines-kids-efficacy-standard-fda/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/HNjhwURa/3s/childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pandemic-treaty-world-health-organization-cola/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=cf719764-03e4-4011-9605-d16b110d2c43
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/HNjhwURa/3s/childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pandemic-treaty-world-health-organization-cola/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=cf719764-03e4-4011-9605-d16b110d2c43
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/HNjhwURa/3s/childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pandemic-treaty-world-health-organization-cola/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=cf719764-03e4-4011-9605-d16b110d2c43
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/sGiED0bW/3s/www.military.com/daily-news/2022/05/13/bigger-bonuses-pentagons-top-weapon-combat-recruiting-crisis-troops-head-exits.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/sGiED0bW/3s/www.military.com/daily-news/2022/05/13/bigger-bonuses-pentagons-top-weapon-combat-recruiting-crisis-troops-head-exits.html
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Resistance Grows to UN WHO & Biden “Global Health” Power Grab 
https://thenewamerican.com/resistance-grows-to-un-who-biden-global-health-
power-grab/ 
  
Nearly 400 million people are under covid lockdown in China 
https://www.msn.com/en-us/news/world/nearly-400-million-people-are-under-
covid-lockdown-in-china/ar-AAX7V1V 
Long COVID symptoms: Researchers find virus hinders cells from generating 
energy in some people 
https://www.clickondetroit.com/health/2022/01/18/long-covid-symptoms-
researchers-find-virus-hinders-cells-from-generating-energy-in-some-people/\ 
  
Do You Need More Proof That They Are Trying to Starve Us on Purpose? 
https://wethepundit.com/do-you-need-more-proof-that-they-are-trying-to-starve-
us-on-purpose/ 
  
Former Russian President Warns West's "Self-Harming" Sanctions Mean 
"Collapse Of US-Centric World" 
https://www.zerohedge.com/geopolitical/whats-next-former-russian-president-
warns-wests-self-harming-sanctions-mean-collapse 
  
Canada 'Covid' Deaths - 99.6% in Vaxxed, 70% in Boosted 
https://sheldonyakiwchuk.substack.com/p/996-of-deaths-in-vaccinated-70-
boosted?s=r 
 
99.6% of COVID deaths in Canada were among vaccinated people 
https://thecountersignal.com/99-per-cent-covid-deaths-in-canada-among-
vaccinated/ 
  
Just Say "No!" to the WHO Pandemic Treaty - Todd Callender, JD, @ 35:50 mins. 
https://www.bitchute.com/video/MDB46JDuS6vu/ 
  
California Legalizes Vaxx of Kids as Young as 12 Without Parental Consent 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-15-california-vaccinating-children-without-
parental-consent.html 
  
People Who Pushed Idea of Universal Vaccination Are ‘Guilty of Crimes Against 
Humanity’: Former Pfizer VP 
https://www.theepochtimes.com/people-who-pushed-idea-of-universal-
vaccination-are-guilty-of-crimes-against-humanity-former-pfizer-
vp_4462787.html?welcomeuser=1 
  
Air Force Cadets May Not Graduate for Refusing Covid Vaxx 
https://www.foxnews.com/us/air-force-cadets-may-not-graduate-refusing-covid-
vaccine 
  

https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/MwLlBaHk/3s/thenewamerican.com/resistance-grows-to-un-who-biden-global-health-power-grab/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/MwLlBaHk/3s/thenewamerican.com/resistance-grows-to-un-who-biden-global-health-power-grab/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/L1fOmV34/3s/www.msn.com/en-us/news/world/nearly-400-million-people-are-under-covid-lockdown-in-china/ar-AAX7V1V
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/L1fOmV34/3s/www.msn.com/en-us/news/world/nearly-400-million-people-are-under-covid-lockdown-in-china/ar-AAX7V1V
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/a7UIbLD1/3s/www.clickondetroit.com/health/2022/01/18/long-covid-symptoms-researchers-find-virus-hinders-cells-from-generating-energy-in-some-people/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/a7UIbLD1/3s/www.clickondetroit.com/health/2022/01/18/long-covid-symptoms-researchers-find-virus-hinders-cells-from-generating-energy-in-some-people/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/HGUivnuc/3s/wethepundit.com/do-you-need-more-proof-that-they-are-trying-to-starve-us-on-purpose/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/HGUivnuc/3s/wethepundit.com/do-you-need-more-proof-that-they-are-trying-to-starve-us-on-purpose/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/5axiYt0q/3s/www.zerohedge.com/geopolitical/whats-next-former-russian-president-warns-wests-self-harming-sanctions-mean-collapse
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/Pa45CMjy/3s/sheldonyakiwchuk.substack.com/p/996-of-deaths-in-vaccinated-70-boosted?s=r
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nr4cEr_ZHnfRI.hNHogq2Ik1cOi/weSTyZ72/3s/thecountersignal.com/99-per-cent-covid-deaths-in-canada-among-vaccinated/
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/9uerSbYJ/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqd4Kg2I5uy4I.gre6huBuJJKaC/W8oYg09G/3s/www.bitchute.com/video/MDB46JDuS6vu/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/wuujvkyC/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqd4Kg2I5uy4I.gre6huBuJJKaC/2Wnt_osx/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-15-california-vaccinating-children-without-parental-consent.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/wuujvkyC/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqd4Kg2I5uy4I.gre6huBuJJKaC/2Wnt_osx/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-15-california-vaccinating-children-without-parental-consent.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/W169njQL/3s/www.theepochtimes.com/people-who-pushed-idea-of-universal-vaccination-are-guilty-of-crimes-against-humanity-former-pfizer-vp_4462787.html?welcomeuser=1
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/zVPzlYrp/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqd4Kg2I5uy4I.gre6huBuJJKaC/rTg4lSzC/3s/www.foxnews.com/us/air-force-cadets-may-not-graduate-refusing-covid-vaccine
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Remdesivir ‘Disastrous’ as COVID Treatment, But Government Pays Hospitals to 
Use It 
https://www.lewrockwell.com/2022/05/joseph-mercola/remdesivir-disastrous-as-
covid-treatment-but-government-pays-hospitals-to-use-it/ 
  
WHO Plans for 10 Years of Pandemics from 2020 to 2030 
https://www.infowars.com/posts/the-plan-who-plans-for-10-years-of-pandemics-
from-2020-to-2030/ 
  
Over $160 BILLION in COVID Unemployment Benefits Likely Lost to Fraud 
https://www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/160-billion-covid-unemployment-
benefits-likely-lost-fraud/ 
  
Mother of six-month-old baby girl describes desperate plight of parents crying in 
Walmart after being faced with empty shelves while hunting for baby formula 
https://www.dailymail.co.uk/news/article-10816455/Mom-describes-parents-
crying-Walmart-faced-shelves-baby-formula.html 
  
Great reset: ‘Famine threatens to wipe out 300 million’ 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-13-famine-threatens-to-wipe-out-300-
million.html 
  
Who Owns Union Pacific Railway and Why Did It Cut Shipping of Fertilizer to 
Farmers? 
https://needtoknow.news/2022/05/%EF%BF%BCwho-owns-union-pacific-railway-
and-why-did-it-cut-shipping-of-fertilizer-to-farmers/ 
 
Child Sacrifice, WEF/WHO Power Grab 
https://rwmalonemd.substack.com/p/child-sacrifice-wef-power-grab?s=r 
  
Australia is Endorsing the WHO Pandemic Treaty 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=gHiAFQGIo00 
  
Senator Warns Biden Against Giving US Lives Over to the WHO Via Treaty 
Amendments 
https://www.wnd.com/2022/05/senator-warns-biden-giving-control-american-lives/ 
   
Grid Operators Are Warning of Rolling Blackouts 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-grid-operators-warn-of-rolling-
blackouts.html 
  
Dirty Bomb Drills Happening in Texas 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-dirty-bomb-drills-austin-tex-known-
radiological-terror-cells-entering-us.html 
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/4D00VzDw/3s/www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/160-billion-covid-unemployment-benefits-likely-lost-fraud/
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/kOeRWCat/3s/www.dailymail.co.uk/news/article-10816455/Mom-describes-parents-crying-Walmart-faced-shelves-baby-formula.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/kOeRWCat/3s/www.dailymail.co.uk/news/article-10816455/Mom-describes-parents-crying-Walmart-faced-shelves-baby-formula.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nqkQIr_ZDrT0D.giLAhF64cUI3h/rsH4AyJM/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-13-famine-threatens-to-wipe-out-300-million.html
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrVOQDIIgrm79.hWecgxAaYNPh_/V32YMPty/3s/rwmalonemd.substack.com/p/child-sacrifice-wef-power-grab?s=r
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrVOQDIIgrm79.hWecgxAaYNPh_/oOh4WdWW/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrKa_wSEVzkOs.hcF8g71LobDqE/pV4tto07/3s/www.youtube.com/watch?v=gHiAFQGIo00
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrVOQDIIgrm79.hWecgxAaYNPh_/h5i3dHTx/3s/www.wnd.com/2022/05/senator-warns-biden-giving-control-american-lives/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrVOQDIIgrm79.hWecgxAaYNPh_/siLhoRqz/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-grid-operators-warn-of-rolling-blackouts.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrVOQDIIgrm79.hWecgxAaYNPh_/siLhoRqz/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-grid-operators-warn-of-rolling-blackouts.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrVOQDIIgrm79.hWecgxAaYNPh_/bzAYY66s/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-dirty-bomb-drills-austin-tex-known-radiological-terror-cells-entering-us.html
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Mass Shootings Are Just One Sign of the Systemic Collapse of Western Society - 
Other Signs Noted 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-16-mass-shootings-just-one-sign-of-the-
systemic-collapse-of-western-society.html 
  
Infants Hospitalized Due to Lack of Formula Can't Get Formula in Hospitals Due 
to Outage 
https://www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/shock-doctors-cant-get-formula-sick-
children-hospitalized-shortage/ 
  
Rep. Cammack Rages as She Finds Huge Stockpile of Baby Formula at Border 
https://www.dailymail.co.uk/news/article-10823567/GOP-Rep-Kat-Cammack-rages-
huge-stockpile-baby-formula-border-center.html 
  
Good Morning America Admits Covid Booster Shots Can Cause AIDS - This is 1st 
MSM admission 
https://www.infowars.com/posts/good-morning-america-admits-covid-booster-
shots-can-cause-aids/ 
  
Babies In Scotland Dying at a Rate 300% Higher Than Normal 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-babies-scotland-dying-rate-300percent-
higher-normal.html 
   
Moderna Vaxx Delivered More Risk Than Benefit for Kids 6 to 11 
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/moderna-vaccine-risk-kids-
trials/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=36fce1ce-6d54-498b-9eaa-62c972c8166c 
  
Why were So Many Adverse Events in Pfizer Vaxx Labeled 'Unrelated'? 
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/fda-pfizer-documents-vaccine-
adverse-events/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=36fce1ce-6d54-498b-9eaa-
62c972c8166c 
  
Missouri Law Passes Prohibiting Pharmacist Questioning of Ivermectin 
or Hydroxychloroquine 
https://www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/missouri-lawmakers-pass-bill-
prohibits-pharmacists-questioning-effectiveness-ivermectin-hydroxychloroquine/ 
  
Big Pharma Out to Depopulate the World With Covid Vaxxes Says Holocaust 
Survivor 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-17-big-pharma-to-depopulate-world-covid-
vaccines.html 
  
Dr. Fuellmich & 50 Lawyers Concluded the Vaxxes Are Designed to Kill & 
Depopulate the Planet 
https://freewestmedia.com/2022/01/10/reiner-fullmich-and-50-lawyers-the-
vaccines-are-designed-to-kill-and-depopulate-the-planet/  
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Canadian Pastors Who Refused to Close Their Churches During Lockdown Win in 
Court 
https://www.activistpost.com/2022/05/canadian-pastors-who-refused-to-close-
church-during-covid-lockdown-win-in-court.html 
 
Former Goldman Sachs CEO Says It's Time to Prepare for a Recession 
https://neonnettle.com/news/19076-former-goldman-sachs-ceo-it-s-time-to-
prepare-for-an-economic-recession- 
  
Digital ID Needed to Buy Food in Iran 
https://www.bitchute.com/video/greg92h1o8Ad/ 
  
Amish Farmer Faces $250k Fine, Jail Time & Loosing His Farm for Processing His 
Own Meat 
https://ourorganicwellness.com/amish-farmer-faces-250k-fine-jail-time-and-
losing-his-sustainable-farm-for-processing-his-own-meat/ 
  
United States D.O.D issued a contract for ‘COVID-19 Research’ in Ukraine 3 
months before COVID-19 officially existed 
https://expose-news.com/2022/05/18/us-dod-covid-research-contract-nov-2019/ 
  
Cobalt Dirty Bombs, Currency Wars and Financial Armageddon 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-18-cobalt-dirty-bombs-mrna-vaccine-
suppression-chromosomes-cancer-death-wave.html 
  
CDC Now Investigating 180 Cases of Children With Hepatitis of “Unknown Cause” 
https://www.infowars.com/posts/cdc-now-investigating-180-cases-of-children-
with-hepatitis-of-unknown-cause/ 
  
Big Pharma-funded Paper Recommends Taxing the Unvaccinated 
https://vaccineimpact.com/2022/big-pharma-funded-paper-recommends-taxing-
the-unvaccinated/ 
https://oxfordtax.sbs.ox.ac.uk/article/taxing-the-unvaccinated 
  
US Government to Extend Covid-19 Public Health Emergency Past July 
https://www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/go-us-government-extend-covid-19-
public-health-emergency-past-july/ 
  
Thoughts from Dean Michele Bachmann on Joe Biden Turning Over US 
Sovereignty to WHO 
https://www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/thoughts-dean-michele-bachmann-
joe-biden-turning-us-sovereignty/ 
  
Pfizer Document Dump Shows Doctor With Ties to Gates Foundation Deleted 
Trial Participant’s Vaccine Injury 
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https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/pwYiT20g/3s/expose-news.com/2022/05/18/us-dod-covid-research-contract-nov-2019/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/O8O4oe0o/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-18-cobalt-dirty-bombs-mrna-vaccine-suppression-chromosomes-cancer-death-wave.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/O8O4oe0o/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-18-cobalt-dirty-bombs-mrna-vaccine-suppression-chromosomes-cancer-death-wave.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/n5doi0B3/3s/www.infowars.com/posts/cdc-now-investigating-180-cases-of-children-with-hepatitis-of-unknown-cause/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/n5doi0B3/3s/www.infowars.com/posts/cdc-now-investigating-180-cases-of-children-with-hepatitis-of-unknown-cause/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/LkcHaJKe/3s/vaccineimpact.com/2022/big-pharma-funded-paper-recommends-taxing-the-unvaccinated/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/LkcHaJKe/3s/vaccineimpact.com/2022/big-pharma-funded-paper-recommends-taxing-the-unvaccinated/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/Yg2TLQ63/3s/oxfordtax.sbs.ox.ac.uk/article/taxing-the-unvaccinated
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/LtNw7u9X/3s/www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/go-us-government-extend-covid-19-public-health-emergency-past-july/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/LtNw7u9X/3s/www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/go-us-government-extend-covid-19-public-health-emergency-past-july/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/O9iX0a7M/3s/www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/thoughts-dean-michele-bachmann-joe-biden-turning-us-sovereignty/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/O9iX0a7M/3s/www.thegatewaypundit.com/2022/05/thoughts-dean-michele-bachmann-joe-biden-turning-us-sovereignty/
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https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-document-doctor-gates-
foundation-deleted-trial-vaccine-
injury/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=0d597c71-4f48-4437-9c39-0d29bbbf8360 
  
Global Food Crisis: Shortages Pose ‘Apocalyptic’ Threat to UK Citizens 
https://www.infowars.com/posts/global-food-crisis-shortages-pose-apocalyptic-
threat-to-uk-citizens/ 
 
Stew Peters on Troop Deaths, He Blames Vaxxes & Gold Star Mom's Report -  
https://rumble.com/v153tij-soldiers-death-sparks-moms-viral-tik-tok-psychopath-
experiments-killing-mil.html 
  
Planned, Orchestrated Extermination of Mankind 
https://www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-18-adams-quayle-discuss-planned-
orchestrated-extermination-mankind.html# 
  
The REAL Threat From the Pandemic Treaty That Most Are Completely Ignoring 
https://noqreport.com/2022/05/17/the-real-threat-from-the-pandemic-treaty-that-
most-are-completely-ignoring/ 
  
 
 

The UK government admits that the COVID-19 Experimental mRNA 
"vaccine" has damaged the natural immune system of those who 
have been double-dosed. 
The government has confessed that double-vaxxed (or more) people, will never  --
 ever  -- be able to acquire full natural immunity to COVID variants - or 
possibly any other virus. 
 
Keen observers of this COVID debacle are now saying "The real pandemic will 
now begin"  because all the people whose immune systems are permanently 
damaged, may not be able to fight-off __any__ future viral infection! 
 
In its Week 42 "COVID-19 Vaccine Surveillance Report," (Direct Link HERE) the 
UK Department of Health admits on page 23 that: 
 
"N antibody levels appear to be lower in people who become infected after two 
doses of [the vax]." 
 
It goes on to say that this drop in antibodies is essentially - get this - permanent. 
What does this mean? Well, we know that the wacky vax does not prevent 
infection or transmission of the China virus (indeed, the report elsewhere shows 
that vaxxed adults are now much more likely to be infected than unvaxxed ones). 
 
The British now find that the vax interferes with the body's ability to make 
antibodies after infection not only against the spike protein but also against other 

https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/pL47JBtH/3s/childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-document-doctor-gates-foundation-deleted-trial-vaccine-injury/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=0d597c71-4f48-4437-9c39-0d29bbbf8360
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/pL47JBtH/3s/childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-document-doctor-gates-foundation-deleted-trial-vaccine-injury/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=0d597c71-4f48-4437-9c39-0d29bbbf8360
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/pL47JBtH/3s/childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/pfizer-document-doctor-gates-foundation-deleted-trial-vaccine-injury/?eType=EmailBlastContent&eId=0d597c71-4f48-4437-9c39-0d29bbbf8360
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/tSbUHdrT/3s/www.infowars.com/posts/global-food-crisis-shortages-pose-apocalyptic-threat-to-uk-citizens/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/tSbUHdrT/3s/www.infowars.com/posts/global-food-crisis-shortages-pose-apocalyptic-threat-to-uk-citizens/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/3GSHQbOd/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nri5Og2IjCzuj.hqJFgN5yEiVcf/S5sU7ZXz/3s/rumble.com/v153tij-soldiers-death-sparks-moms-viral-tik-tok-psychopath-experiments-killing-mil.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/3GSHQbOd/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nri5Og2IjCzuj.hqJFgN5yEiVcf/S5sU7ZXz/3s/rumble.com/v153tij-soldiers-death-sparks-moms-viral-tik-tok-psychopath-experiments-killing-mil.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/AZnhZ0-L/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nri5Og2IjCzuj.hqJFgN5yEiVcf/ubYqHPG8/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-18-adams-quayle-discuss-planned-orchestrated-extermination-mankind.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/AZnhZ0-L/3s/link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nri5Og2IjCzuj.hqJFgN5yEiVcf/ubYqHPG8/3s/www.naturalnews.com/2022-05-18-adams-quayle-discuss-planned-orchestrated-extermination-mankind.html
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/gD-s29Nj/3s/noqreport.com/2022/05/17/the-real-threat-from-the-pandemic-treaty-that-most-are-completely-ignoring/
https://link.vaxxchoice.com/click/1nrnxTDII-duSC.hnoUgjZHYwWEc/gD-s29Nj/3s/noqreport.com/2022/05/17/the-real-threat-from-the-pandemic-treaty-that-most-are-completely-ignoring/
https://assets.publishing.service.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/1027511/Vaccine-surveillance-report-week-42.pdf
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parts of the virus.  In particular, vaxxed persons do not appear to form antibodies 
against the nucleocapsid protein - the envelope of the virus (which is a crucial 
part of the response in unvaccinated people). 
 
In the long term, the vaxxed are far more susceptible to any mutations in the 
COVID spike protein, even if they have already been infected and cured once or 
more. 
 
The unvaccinated, on the other hand, gain lasting - if not permanent - immunity to 
all strains of the alleged virus after being naturally infected with it even once. 
 
A win-win for those who kept their heads, and didn't buy-into all the COVID hype. 
 
A no-win for those who went with the crowd, or were willfully obtuse, 
intellectually lazy, or arrogant. 
 

 
 
One of the most informative books on the Rockefeller Medical 
Industry was published in 2016.  ‘Murder by Injection: The Story of the 

Medical Conspiracy Against America’ by Eustace Mullins.  The late Eustace 
Mullins has authored a number of expose category books, among the more 
famous is ‘The Secrets of the Federal Reserve System’.   
 
A picture of ‘Murder by Injection’ has been included below.  This book is a truth- 
telling expose of how the famous oil magnate John D. Rockefeller used his 
fortune to take over the medical and health profession over a century ago.  The 
Rockefeller’s about fifteen years ago threw in their assets and power with the 
House of Rothschild to bring about the ultimate destruction of the United States.   
 
Most of you would not know this but in 1911 when the Rockefeller Standard Oil 
was broken up through legislation under the Sherman Anti-Trust Act into what is 
commonly referred to as the “Seven Sisters” oil companies, Rockefeller was 
heard to have said that he would destroy America one day.    
 
Health care and medicine today is a product of the Rockefeller “Allopathic” 
medicine, i.e. “drugs, radiation, and surgery; pretty much the exact opposite of 
“Naturopathic” or “Homeopathic” medicine.  Most doctors will admit that in their 
medical training they learn nothing about nutrition, vitamins, nutrients, natural 
therapies, clean air, water, food, and sanitation.   
 
The Rockefeller school of medicine is all about chemicals and their derived drugs 
to treat people.  Eustace Mullins book shows how Rockefeller money was used to 
capture health care and creating customers rather than curing people! 
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The “Seven Sisters” have since merged in recent years from what the U.S. 
government had broken the Standard Oil Trust into: 
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Marburg Pathogen will be activated in the Vaxxed via 5G 
source: 
 
This next report is further evidence that the past two years has not 
been about a rogue novel virus but proof of the long ago planned 
“Depopulation” of the world.  The known evidence confirms that 
those behind this Global MASS MURDER used many vectors of attack 
on humanity.  By this we know that not all vaccine doses were 
identical.  It was revealed many months ago that specific LOTS of the 
Vaxxes were more poisonous or toxic than others.  Victims were 
subject to the luck of the draw through the lot distribution system of 
the vials of vaxxes. 
 
This is going to be important with the next phase of the virus scare 
factor.  The next phase is likely to be a combination of more toxic and 
lethal pathogens such as the Bird Flu, Marburg, Ebola, Covid-20, etc.  
The data shows those who are fully vaxxed with at least one booster 
shot are going to experience re-infection.  This will in turn be used to 
scare those who refused to take the jabs the first time into submitting 
as this next phase begins in a couple months.   The Biden 
administration has already purchased millions of doses for a monkey 
pox virus now we have monkey pox – a viral infection that is 
traditionally mild and rare in humans – popping up all across the 
Western countries. Oddly enough, the virus is seemingly spreading 
from person to person like never before, leaving many people, 
including those in the scientific community, scratching their heads 
and asking themselves: ‘what is going on?’ 
 
With a recent surge of over a 100 cases in Europe, the first positive 
case being confirmed in the U.S. on Wednesday in Massachusetts, 
and a second potential case Now being investigated by health 
officials in New York City, the Biden administration is wasting no time 
in ‘preparing’ for the next public health emergency. 
 
On Thursday, the Federal government ordered 13 million monkey pox 
vaccines from the European biotechnology company Bavarian-
Nordic, according to Newsweek. In all, a total of $119 million was 
spent on the ‘Jynneos’ vaccines, which works out to about $ 9.15 per 
dose. 
 



16 
 

Many of us recall the video clip showing Microsoft co-founder Bill 
Gates and Melinda Gates smirking while talking about a second wave 
of the pandemic has gone viral on Twitter. The clip shared widely by 
those opposing Gates has given rise to yet another set of conspiracy 
theories related to the power couple. Bill Gates said "the next one 
[pandemic] will really get our attention" and Peter Schwartz, author of 
Operation Lockstep, said "we are in an era of pandemics; this is not 
the last one." 
 
This is a huge lie that Bill Gates and Peter Schwartz can use to hide 
the fact that through CRISPR-Cas9 technologies, man can create an 
“endless” string of man-made viruses without the public knowing the 
truth!  I began reporting on CRISPR-Cas9 two years ago as to what it 
could do in the wrong hands with nefarious goals in mind. 
 

Marburg Pathogen will be activated in the Vaxxed via 5G 
source: (Marburg Virus has a 88% fatality rate!) 
  
https://www.bitchute.com/video/4ajhXs6ykjhs/ 
Todd Callender joins the The Prather Point to discuss the next PLANdemic (the 
Marburg pathogen), which will be the excuse used to force the unvaxxed into 
quarantine camps (FEMA) where kill-shots will be administered. 
 
He also says that those who received the Covid shots already have the dormant 
Marburg virus encapsulated in lipid nanoparticles, which can be activated via 5G 
frequencies. Those who have Marburg will then become zombie-like, because it 
affects frontal cortex brain function.  
  

https://rumble.com/v14zdrf-marburg-will-be-activated-in-the-vaxxed-via-5g.html 

 
 
CDRI SSTRATCOM CONPLAN 8888-11 "COUNTER-ZOMBIE DOMINANCE" 30 
APRIL 2011 
https://www.stratcom.mil/Portals/8/Documents/FOIA/CONPLAN_8888-
11.pdf?ver=2016-10-17-114016-887 
https://www.truthforhealth.org/ 
https://www.vaxxchoice.com/ 
https://jeffreyprather.com/ 
SOURCE: Agent Of Change 
https://www.bitchute.com/video/OGVeFG1x3AH3/ 
Also see: 
Coming Marburg, 5G & Mind Control - Maria Zeee w/ Todd Callendar and Dr. Peter 

https://www.bitchute.com/video/4ajhXs6ykjhs/
https://rumble.com/v14zdrf-marburg-will-be-activated-in-the-vaxxed-via-5g.html
https://www.stratcom.mil/Portals/8/Documents/FOIA/CONPLAN_8888-11.pdf?ver=2016-10-17-114016-887
https://www.stratcom.mil/Portals/8/Documents/FOIA/CONPLAN_8888-11.pdf?ver=2016-10-17-114016-887
https://www.truthforhealth.org/
https://www.vaxxchoice.com/
https://jeffreyprather.com/
https://www.bitchute.com/video/OGVeFG1x3AH3/
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Chambers (48:23) 
https://www.bitchute.com/video/3GGXZS3uvz2t/ 
Nov. 28, 2021 Swiss Referendum - NO to Green Pass - Marburg Virus is the Next 
Planned Pandemic (52:18) 
https://www.bitchute.com/video/Z8QN90S8DZa5/ 
ZOMBIE Ah Pock O' Lips - Psychological Operations (5:48) 
https://www.bitchute.com/video/gCPArQrfUfUe/ 
 
If you have any doubt that “Depopulation” has been the #1 issue for the past half-
century, I challenge you to read and listen to the plandemic’s next phase.  
Marburg Virus is related to Ebola and the plan is to activate those already vaxxed 
through the use of a frequency of wireless energy.  They plan to use the 18 GHz 
signal frequency to further cull the population.  The powers at be will flip the 5G 
switch and those having taken the vaxx will be used to finish them off. 
 
In articles that I have written on 5G wireless energy, I have shared information on 
the process of “Electroporation” in which wireless energy can be used to induce, 
insert, and alter a person’s DNA.  The combination of CRISPR-Cas9 and wireless 
energy beams a dose of energy to attack human life form.  This is the ultimate in 
what is essentially a “Directed Energy Weapon.” 
  

In electrophoresis, charged solid particles move under an external electrical field. 
And electroporation is the DNA transfer into the cell. It has been shown recently 
that electrically induce electrically DNA transfer into cell is a fast vectoral process 
with the same difference as DNA electrophoresis transfer into external electrical 
field..  Truly the weapon that leaves no smoking gun behind! 

 
You now know why the world has been racing to debut its 5th generation of 
wireless energy.  That said, they are well along in the process of work on the next 
stage that will make humans dispensable. 
 
And that is, inside of these shots, that people already received, inside the lipid 
nanoparticles, the Hydrogel, there exist pathogens, inside of the particles that 
have not yet opened. Those pathogens are chimeric. They include e coli, 
Marburg, Ebola, staphylococcus and Brewer’s Yeast, amongst others. 
 
We know that, upon the broadcast from the 5G system, that is now employed 
across the United States – and the world, for that matter – when they broadcast 
an 18 GHz signal [satellite TV frequency range] for one minute, three different 
times, as a pulse, it will cause those lipid nanoparticles to swell and release these 
pathogenic contents, thereby causing a Marburg epidemic, that they’ve already 
spent the money on. It’s already done, right? 
 
The Marburg epidemic, for the purposes of the law has happened and now, we 
just need the actual disaster to happen and there are actually worse parts to it 

https://www.bitchute.com/video/3GGXZS3uvz2t/
https://www.bitchute.com/video/Z8QN90S8DZa5/
https://www.bitchute.com/video/gCPArQrfUfUe/
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-c3cceyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL2VuLndpa2lwZWRpYS5vcmdcL3dpa2lcL1NhdGVsbGl0ZV90ZWxldmlzaW9uIiwibmV3c2xldHRlcklkIjoiMTI1OSIsInN1YnNjcmliZXJJZCI6MjExMywiZG9tYWluIjoiZm9yYmlkZGVua25vd2xlZGdldHYiLCJ0aW1lIjoxNjUyOTYyMDg1LCJkZWwiOjEwLCJzZW5kZXIiOjF9
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than that, including the 1p36 Gene Deletion that effectively will turn those poor 
people into zombies. As odd as that sounds, our government’s preparing for that. 
 
Rights activist attorney, Todd Callender has been defending U.S. servicemen 
from being forced to take the death shot. He joins Jeffrey to discuss the next 
plandemic, with the release of the Marburg pathogen, which he says will be the 
excuse used to force the unvaxxed into FEMA quarantine camps, where they will 
be administered the death shot. 
 
Todd says that those who received the COVID shots already have in their bodies 
the dormant Marburg virus encapsulated in lipid nanoparticles, which would be 
released into their tissues via a specific pattern of pulsed 5G frequencies. 
 
He says those who have Marburg will then become zombie-like, due to 
the 1p36 Gene Deletion, which affects the frontal cortex of the brain and is listed 
alphabetically by Pfizer as the first “adverse event of special interest”, 
in documents that they were forced to release by FOIA request several weeks 
ago. 
 
I’ve looked at the Pfizer document and this 1p36 Gene Deletion is listed first as an 
adverse event, not because it is the most common but because “1p36” is 
alphabetically the first adverse event, among the thousands listed.  
 
It will be hard to find anything on use of wireless energy, yet to substantiate what 
he says, below about the 18 GHz frequency being pulsed three times to cause the 
lipid nanoparticles to expand and release the Marburg pathogen into the bodies 
of the vaxxinated. Todd says he’s been contacted by some 500 whistleblowers so 
maybe he got that information from one of them.  With CRISPR-Cas9 there is 
great secrecy on the military research.   
 
It’s very, very weird that all kinds of government agencies have been training for 
a Zombie Apocalypse for over a decade but I’m not too concerned about brain-
eating zombies from the Night of the Living Dead attacking me. 
 
I think we’re already living in a Zombie Apocalypse of people who believe the fake 
news and who are actually giving their infants the death shot.  
 
What I can verify and what I do think is worthy of concern is the HHS’ December 
2020 Notice of Declaration Under the PREP Act for Countermeasures Against 
Marburg Disease.  
 
If we’ve learned anything from Event 201 and the SPARS document, such 
declarations and drills can definitely indicate that we will be seeing the rollout of 
what they’re declaring and training for. 

 
 

https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-4936eyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL2ZvcmJpZGRlbmtub3dsZWRnZXR2Lm5ldFwva2lsbC1ncmlkLXRoZS12YXh4LTVnLWFuZC1zbWFydC1waG9uZXMtYXJlLWluZXh0cmljYWJseS1saW5rZWRcLyIsIm5ld3NsZXR0ZXJJZCI6IjEyNTkiLCJzdWJzY3JpYmVySWQiOjIxMTMsImRvbWFpbiI6ImZvcmJpZGRlbmtub3dsZWRnZXR2IiwidGltZSI6MTY1Mjk2MjA4NSwiZGVsIjoxMCwic2VuZGVyIjoxfQ
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-4cc6eyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL2ZvcmJpZGRlbmtub3dsZWRnZXR2Lm5ldFwvcXVhcmFudGluZWQtY2FtcHMtYXQtdHVmdHMtdVwvIiwibmV3c2xldHRlcklkIjoiMTI1OSIsInN1YnNjcmliZXJJZCI6MjExMywiZG9tYWluIjoiZm9yYmlkZGVua25vd2xlZGdldHYiLCJ0aW1lIjoxNjUyOTYyMDg1LCJkZWwiOjEwLCJzZW5kZXIiOjF9
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-053beyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL21lZGxpbmVwbHVzLmdvdlwvZ2VuZXRpY3NcL2NvbmRpdGlvblwvMXAzNi1kZWxldGlvbi1zeW5kcm9tZVwvIiwibmV3c2xldHRlcklkIjoiMTI1OSIsInN1YnNjcmliZXJJZCI6MjExMywiZG9tYWluIjoiZm9yYmlkZGVua25vd2xlZGdldHYiLCJ0aW1lIjoxNjUyOTYyMDg1LCJkZWwiOjEwLCJzZW5kZXIiOjF9
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-815deyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL3BobXB0Lm9yZ1wvd3AtY29udGVudFwvdXBsb2Fkc1wvMjAyMVwvMTFcLzUuMy42LXBvc3RtYXJrZXRpbmctZXhwZXJpZW5jZS5wZGYiLCJuZXdzbGV0dGVySWQiOiIxMjU5Iiwic3Vic2NyaWJlcklkIjoyMTEzLCJkb21haW4iOiJmb3JiaWRkZW5rbm93bGVkZ2V0diIsInRpbWUiOjE2NTI5NjIwODUsImRlbCI6MTAsInNlbmRlciI6MX0
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-b053eyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL2VuLndpa2lwZWRpYS5vcmdcL3dpa2lcL1ByZXBhcmVkbmVzc18xMDE6X1pvbWJpZV9BcG9jYWx5cHNlIiwibmV3c2xldHRlcklkIjoiMTI1OSIsInN1YnNjcmliZXJJZCI6MjExMywiZG9tYWluIjoiZm9yYmlkZGVua25vd2xlZGdldHYiLCJ0aW1lIjoxNjUyOTYyMDg1LCJkZWwiOjEwLCJzZW5kZXIiOjF9
https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-7a81eyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cHM6XC9cL3d3dy5mZWRlcmFscmVnaXN0ZXIuZ292XC9kb2N1bWVudHNcLzIwMjBcLzEyXC8wOVwvMjAyMC0yNjk3Mlwvbm90aWNlLW9mLWRlY2xhcmF0aW9uLXVuZGVyLXRoZS1wdWJsaWMtcmVhZGluZXNzLWFuZC1lbWVyZ2VuY3ktcHJlcGFyZWRuZXNzLWFjdC1mb3ItY291bnRlcm1lYXN1cmVzIiwibmV3c2xldHRlcklkIjoiMTI1OSIsInN1YnNjcmliZXJJZCI6MjExMywiZG9tYWluIjoiZm9yYmlkZGVua25vd2xlZGdldHYiLCJ0aW1lIjoxNjUyOTYyMDg1LCJkZWwiOjEwLCJzZW5kZXIiOjF9
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////////////////////////////////////////////////TRANSCRIPT/////////////////////////////////////////////// 
OF PROGRAM INTERVIEW FOLLOWS 

 
TODD CALLENDER: What I want to impart to you is, under 42 CFR parts 70 and 
71, that's the enabling statute for Health and Human Services to assume power 
upon the declaration of a Public Health Emergency. They've already done that, as 
you indicated with the COVID crisis that has resulted in the suspension of our 
Constitution. It's already happened. 
 
The next one is coming. In that statute, you will see that Marburg is already 
identified, you will note that the PREP Act has a Marburg Provision, that allows 
for additional spending, when invoked. 
 
The Health and Human Services has already invoked the Marburg Provision, 
meaning they've already parted ways with money and spent it, under the HHS 
Enabling Statute to build quarantine camps, among other things, throughout the 
United States. 
 
We interrupted two, one of which was in Cochise County, Arizona, where they 
were going to build a $1.9 million facility that houses the now-merged four 
branches under HHS: the Judiciary, Law Enforcement, Corrections and Public 
Health are now all one and the same. And they're all housed in the same facility. 
 
So, all these quarantine centers are there, we understand that there could have 
been a Marburg release that Dr. Chambers will get into. We think that one has 
already happened. We know that Marburg is not particularly contagious but it has 
an extraordinarily high rate of fatality and we know the mechanism by which this 
will be released. 
 
And that is, inside of these shots, that people already received, inside the lipid 
nanoparticles, the Hydrogel, there exist pathogens, inside of the particles that 
have not yet opened. Those pathogens are chimeric. They include e coli, 
Marburg, Ebola, staphylococcus and Brewer's Yeast, amongst others. 
 
We know that, upon the broadcast from the 5G system, that is now employed 
across the United States – and the world, for that matter – when they broadcast 
an 18 GHz signal [satellite TV frequency range] for one minute, three different 
times, as a pulse, it will cause those lipid nanoparticles to swell and release these 
pathogenic contents, thereby causing a Marburg epidemic, that they've already 
spent the money on. It's already done, right? 
 
The Marburg epidemic, for the purposes of the law has happened and now, we 
just need the actual disaster to happen and there are actually worse parts to it 
than that, including the 1p36 Gene Deletion, that effectively will turn those poor 
people into zombies. As odd as that sounds, our government's preparing for that. 
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JEFFREY PRATHER: But the FEMA have already put out zombie commercials and 
CONOPS on that, correct? 
 
TODD CALLENDER: That's correct. If you look at CONPLAN 8888, Stratcom put 
that out in 2011, on page 2, they say, "Oh, this is just for example, it's just for 
demonstration, don't worry about it. It's so we don't offend other countries." 
 
The problem with that is you look through that and it's all about five different 
kinds of zombies. There isn't anything in there about opposition forces, there isn't 
anything about winning political battles, or counterinsurgencies, and it is only 
about a "Zombie Apocalypse", defending it. 
 
And you will see that every NIMS-compliant – practically – agency, whether that's 
state, local or federal has already had their Zombie Apocalypse Preparedness 
Training, they've already done their practice. 
 
The CDC has had a Zombie Apocalypse Preparedness website up for the last 5 
years, now they've reduced it to a PDF cartoon. 
 
Even in the Amazon Web Services contract, the force majeure clause, I believe it's 
Article 41, states that, "We're not liable for damages, in case there's a Zombie 
Apocalypse." 
 
This is coming, Folks. And the Serious Adverse Event Report Pfizer put out, post-
marketing – they have put out, it's part of a FOIA – the number one Serious 
Adverse Event was the 1p36 gene deletion [this appears on page 30 in the 
document above and it appears first, because alphabetically, "1p36" is the first of 
thousands of debilitating conditions that Pfizer admitted to have been caused by 
the vaxx by February of 2021. – A. Bruce]. 
 
If you look up the symptomology for that, it is the elimination of the frontal cortex 
and the propensity to bite. 
 
What's very odd about this is this was the symptom, post-vaccination. That 
disease is a congenital disease. It means you're born with it. So how was it, then 
possible that this is the number one Adverse Event from the Pfizer shots? 
 
It's here, Folks. And then, you've got Dr. Chambers, here to tell you that I'm not 
just a raving lunatic! 
 
JEFFREY PRATHER: No, no. These are both very serious, credentialed folks and 
Patriots in their fields. I just met Dr. Chambers but just hearing his military 
résumé impresses me and Todd and I have known each other for quite some 
time. 
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And I also now work in corporate, competitive biotech intelligence – only for the 
Good Guys – that's my company, it's GRINX, which is Genetics, Robotics, 
Information and Nanotechnology, don't talk about that much...So, I have some 
understanding of what's going on, here. 
 
So, the lipid fat is what encases the delivery and then it is activated and released 
by pulsing the 18 GHz. Is that correct, Todd? 
 
TODD CALLENDER: Yeah. That's exactly right. Think of the lipid nanoparticles as little 
bombers. What happened is the various manufacturers of these shots included 
three separate HIV proteins in each of them, including the AD5 adjuvant. 
 
The reason for that was to disable, to disarm peoples' immune systems so that 
those little fat bombers could go inside of the cell and deliver their payloads, in 
order to re-program the person's body to produce synthetic DNA. In this case, 
they call it the S-proteins. 
 
When they turn that Marburg switch on, it will be N-proteins. It will cause the 
people to produce the Marburg pathogen, themselves... 
 
First and foremost, from a documentary point of view and self-legal 
help, Vaxxchoice.com is a full repository of everything that we're talking about 
and other things; self-help legal documents, that if you sign up, you can get a 
daily update. There's no donation button, there's no nothing. We just put this out 
for peoples' benefit. 
  
Separately, there's TruthForHealth.org. Dr. Lee Vliet is in charge of that and she's 
put out a Marburg fact sheet, along with some things that we can do to try and 
stop what's coming or at least prevent it. 
 
Just like the COVID situation, there are medications that Dr. Chambers can talk 
about, there is therapeutics. Of course, the CDC got rid of those therapeutics in 
its advisory, saying the only thing you can do to treat Marburg is a vaxxine. 
There's one actually already prepared for this. I think it's getting its Emergency 
Use Authorization, right now, which also tells us this is going to happen. 
 
Secondarily, yesterday, we got information from a source, from a whistleblower, 
showing us that they are now training people on Urban Collection, Isolation and 
Detention, in reference to a Public Health Emergency. 
 
So they're now training. This training happens next week in South Carolina and 
once again, in July. I'm sure that this is happening in more than one place. 
 
The United Nations has already hired specialists in quarantining. That is on their 
payroll. That happened last year. I haven't seen if they've done it more recently. 
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My point in telling you this, Folks is that we have tools to not fall for this again. 
There are therapeutic drugs that are available. I think one of them is 
called Fenben in the 444mg and then, I understand, from talking to doctors in 
Africa that have treated this, that ozone, either IV or insufflate, it also tends to 
work. 
 
I also have one whistleblower inside of FEMA, who said that the plan is to scare 
the hell out of everybody and scare them into going to the quarantine centers, 
because they don't think they can collect everybody, by themselves. The doors 
will be open and then of course, in there, you'll get your mandatory shot, because 
you came in voluntarily. 
 
So what we'd like to do is help people understand: Don't run into the FEMA 
camps, because you're going to get one of these shots, just like the COVID ones. 
And number two, you can treat this yourself, there's preparation you can do and if 
we get the word out sufficiently, I think we can stop this, like we did in Cochise 
County and like another lawyer friend of mine, Jamie Scheer did in New York. 
We've got to get the word out, we've got to stop this... 
 
Upon the invocation of these Emergency Powers, which are now permanent, by 
the way, in all 50 states. There is never again going to be a Constitution and all of 
that power is being ceded in the WHO – now, by contract. It was by charter. Now, 
it's by contract. 
 
So, this is your One World Government, all being created at one time with this 
particular emergency. Your rights, as a human being are gone, by the way. 
 
There are two UN conventions: The International Convention on Civil & Political 
Rights and the International Convention on Human Rights, that says they cannot 
force you to do medical experiments. Guess what? Those don't count anymore. 
Your Constitution doesn't count, anymore. 
 
We're in a position where, We, the People, at a county level – and Dr. Chambers 
will talk about this – we take back our country from our own traitors in our 
government or we're done. We're done, as a species. 
 
My biggest issue is this: the next shoe to drop is coming and then, they will 
cause 30 million people to pour across our borders. Most of those will be enemy 
occupiers. Some are already housed on our military reservations, as our military 
members are falling out, because they were forced to get these shots. Others are 
prepared to walk in and take over. 
 
The Law of War states that when alien occupiers take over substantial 
government functions, your nation is dead. That is happening, as we speak, right 
now and we've got to take our country back now, or it's never. 
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JEFFREY PRATHER: Well, thank you so much, Todd and I'll probably have you 
guys both on my cast next week or the week after that, if you're available. 
 
This is really important. I'm going to ask Mike Adams and Bob Day at Brighteon 
TV to write up articles about this and get this and get this out. 
 
It's really important. Thanks. And again, your website is? Both of them? 
 
TODD CALLENDER: Vaxxchoice.com and TruthForHealth.org 
Thank you, Jeffrey. I appreciate you having me. 
 
 

 

 

VAERS Data Show New Deaths, Injuries After COVID Vaccines, As 
CDC Signs Off on 3rd Shot for Kids 5-11 
VAERS data released Friday by the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention show 
1,268,008 reports of adverse events from all age groups following COVID-19 vaccines, 
including 28,141 deaths and 230,364 serious injuries between Dec. 14, 2020, and May 
13, 2022.  By Megan Redshaw 
 
The Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC) today released new data 
showing a total of 1,268,008 reports of adverse events following COVID-
19 vaccines were submitted between Dec. 14, 2020, and May 13, 2022, to the 
Vaccine Adverse Event Reporting System (VAERS). 
 
VAERS is the primary government-funded system for reporting adverse vaccine 
reactions in the U.S. 
 
The data included a total of 28,141 reports of deaths — an increase of 173 over 
the previous week — and 230,364 serious injuries, including deaths, during the 
same time period — up 1,887 compared with the previous week. There were 6,859 
additional total adverse events reported to VAERS over the previous week. 
 
Excluding “foreign reports” to VAERS, 817,538 adverse events, including 12,961 
deaths and 82,544 serious injuries, were reported in the U.S. between Dec. 14, 
2020, and May 13, 2022. 
 
Foreign reports are reports foreign subsidiaries send to U.S. vaccine 
manufacturers. Under U.S. Food and Drug Administration (FDA) regulations, if a 
manufacturer is notified of a foreign case report that describes an event that is 
both serious and does not appear on the product’s labeling, the manufacturer is 
required to submit the report to VAERS. 
 
Of the 12,961 U.S. deaths reported as of May 13, 16% occurred within 24 hours of 
vaccination, 20% occurred within 48 hours of vaccination and 59% occurred in 

https://forbiddenknowledgetv.slrcdn.com/track/click?linkData=1-7a27eyJsaW5rIjoiaHR0cDpcL1wvdmF4eGNob2ljZS5jb21cLyIsIm5ld3NsZXR0ZXJJZCI6IjEyNTkiLCJzdWJzY3JpYmVySWQiOjIxMTMsImRvbWFpbiI6ImZvcmJpZGRlbmtub3dsZWRnZXR2IiwidGltZSI6MTY1Mjk2MjA4NSwiZGVsIjoxMCwic2VuZGVyIjoxfQ
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people who experienced an onset of symptoms within 48 hours of being 
vaccinated. 
In the U.S., 581 million COVID-19 vaccine doses had been administered as of May 
13, including 343 million doses of Pfizer, 219 million doses of Moderna and 19 
million doses of Johnson & Johnson (J&J). 
 

 
 
Every Friday, VAERS publishes vaccine injury reports received as of a specified 
date. Reports submitted to VAERS require further investigation before a causal 
relationship can be confirmed. 
 
Historically, VAERS has been shown to report only 1% of actual vaccine adverse 
events. 
 
U.S. VAERS data from Dec. 14, 2020, to May 13, 2022, for 5- to 11-year-olds show: 
 

 10,745 adverse events, including 279 rated as serious and 5 reported 
deaths. 

 22 reports of myocarditis and pericarditis (heart inflammation).The CDC 
uses a narrowed case definition of “myocarditis,” which excludes cases of 
cardiac arrest, ischemic strokes and deaths due to heart problems that 
occur before one has the chance to go to the emergency department.  The 
Defender has noticed over previous weeks that reports of myocarditis and 
pericarditis have been removed by the CDC from the VAERS system in this 
age group. No explanation was provided. 

https://medalerts.org/vaersdb/findfield.php?TABLE=ON&GROUP1=ONS&EVENTS=ON&VAX=COVID19&VAXTYPES=COVID-19&STATE=NOTFR
https://ourworldindata.org/grapher/covid-vaccine-doses-by-manufacturer?country=~USA
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https://digital.ahrq.gov/sites/default/files/docs/publication/r18hs017045-lazarus-final-report-2011.pdf
https://digital.ahrq.gov/sites/default/files/docs/publication/r18hs017045-lazarus-final-report-2011.pdf
https://medalerts.org/vaersdb/findfield.php?TABLE=ON&GROUP1=AGE&EVENTS=ON&VAX=COVID19&STATE=NOTFR&WhichAge=range&LOWAGE=5&HIGHAGE=12
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https://medalerts.org/vaersdb/findfield.php?TABLE=ON&GROUP1=AGE&EVENTS=ON&VAX=COVID19&DIED=Yes&STATE=NOTFR&WhichAge=range&LOWAGE=5&HIGHAGE=12
https://medalerts.org/vaersdb/findfield.php?TABLE=ON&GROUP1=AGE&EVENTS=ON&VAX=COVID19&DIED=Yes&STATE=NOTFR&WhichAge=range&LOWAGE=5&HIGHAGE=12
https://medalerts.org/vaersdb/findfield.php?TABLE=ON&GROUP1=AGE&EVENTS=ON&SYMPTOMS%5b%5d=Myocarditis+%2810028606%29&SYMPTOMS%5b%5d=Pericarditis+%2810034484%29&VAX=COVID19&STATE=NOTFR&WhichAge=range&LOWAGE=5&HIGHAGE=12
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/autopsies-vaccinating-teens-covid-heartbreaking/
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/defender/joseph-keating-autopsy-death-myocarditis-pfizer-covid-vaccine/
https://www.stroke.org/en/about-stroke/types-of-stroke/ischemic-stroke-clots
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 43 reports of blood clotting disorders. 
U.S. VAERS data from Dec. 14, 2020, to May 13, 2022, for 12- to 17-year-olds 
show: 
 

 31,572 adverse events, including 1,824 rated as serious and 44 reported 
deaths. VAERS reported 44 deaths in the 12- to 17-year-old age group last 
week. 

 64 reports of anaphylaxis among 12- to 17-year-olds where the reaction 
was life-threatening, required treatment or resulted in death — with 96% of 
cases attributed to Pfizer’s vaccine. 

 651 reports of myocarditis and pericarditis with 639 cases attributed to 
Pfizer’s vaccine. 

 168 reports of blood clotting disorders with all cases attributed to Pfizer. 
 
U.S. VAERS data from Dec. 14, 2020, to May 13, 2022, for all age groups 
combined, show: 
 

 20% of deaths were related to cardiac disorders. 
 54% of those who died were male, 41% were female and the remaining 

death reports did not include the gender of the deceased. 
 The average age of death was 73. 
 As of May 13, 5,527 pregnant women reported adverse events related to 

COVID-19 vaccines, including 1,732 reports of miscarriage or premature 
birth. 

 Of the 3,622 cases of Bell’s Palsy reported, 51% were attributed 
to Pfizer vaccinations, 40% to Moderna and 8% to J&J. 

 880 reports of Guillain-Barré syndrome, with 42% of cases attributed to 
Pfizer, 30% to Moderna and 28% to J&J. 

 2,291 reports of anaphylaxis where the reaction was life-threatening, 
required treatment or resulted in death. 

 1,707 reports of myocardial infarction. 
 13,972 reports of blood-clotting disorders in the U.S. Of those, 6,266 

reports were attributed to Pfizer, 4,989 reports to Moderna and 2,679 
reports to J&J. 

 4,194 cases of myocarditis and pericarditis with 2,570 cases attributed to 
Pfizer’s, 1,427 cases to Moderna’s and 183 cases to J&J’s COVID-19 
vaccines. 
 

Children’s Health Defense (CHD) asks anyone who has experienced an adverse 
reaction, to any vaccine, to file a report following these three steps. 
 
CDC vaccine advisory panel follows FDA lead, endorses 3rd Pfizer shot for kids 5 
to 11. 
 
The CDC’s independent vaccine advisory panel on Thursday endorsed a third 
dose of the Pfizer-BioNTech COVID-19 vaccine for children ages 5 to 11. 
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CDC Director Dr. Rochelle Walensky signed off on the Advisory Committee on 
Immunization Practices (ACIP) recommendation, clearing the way for healthcare 
workers to begin administering the shots. 
 
The ACIP recommendation came two days after the FDA granted Pfizer’s 
request for Emergency Use Authorization (EUA) of a single booster dose for this 
age group, saying the third shot should be administered at least five months after 
the initial two-dose primary series with the Pfizer-BioNTech vaccine. 
 
The FDA granted the EUA without convening its vaccine advisory panel of 
independent experts to discuss Pfizer’s data on 5- to 11-year-olds. 
 
The authorization was based on a study subset of only 67 children who exhibited 
higher antibody levels one month after receiving a booster dose. 
 
The FDA granted EUA for the boosters despite data showing higher infection 
rates among fully vaccinated children in the 5-to-11 age group compared to 
unvaccinated children, no studies testing the efficacy of the vaccine against the 
current dominant BA.2 COVID-19 variant and two new studies showing that for 
vaccinated people who get Omicron, the infection provides better protection 
against future infections than a second booster dose. 
 
The FDA said it did not identify any new safety concerns and found the children 
in the trial experienced the same mild side effects other people do after receiving 
a booster. 
 
However, a subset of only 67 children is not large enough to detect potential 
adverse events like myocarditis, and it is unknown how rapidly any protection 
provided wanes because trial participants were not followed beyond a 28-day 
period. 
 
Pfizer documents show many adverse events deemed ‘unrelated’ to vaccine. 
 
The latest release by the FDA of Pfizer vaccine documents raises questions about 
how frequently adverse events experienced by clinical trial participants were 
reported as “unrelated” to the vaccine. 
 
The 80,000-page document cache released May 2 includes an extensive set of 
Case Report Forms (CRFs) from Pfizer trials conducted at various locations in the 
U.S. 
 
The reports are from participants who suffered some type of adverse event 
during their participation in Pfizer’s vaccine trials. 
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As the documents reveal, despite the occurrence of a wide range of symptoms 
including serious cardiovascular events, almost none were identified as being 
“related” to the vaccine. 
 
Only one adverse event is clearly specified as being related to the vaccination: a 
participant who suffered from psoriatic arthritis, with no prior history of the 
condition. 
 
In addition, several CRFs indicated exposure during pregnancy or during a 
partner’s pregnancy. However, the documents provided do not appear to have 
provided any follow-ups regarding any outcomes or potential adverse events for 
the participants, their partners or their newborn babies once born. 
 
In some instances, while the CRFs claimed the adverse events suffered by 
patients were unrelated to the vaccine, their cause was unspecified — simply 
indicated as “other” — while in another case, a participant’s “unplanned” small 
bowel obstruction and panic attacks were listed as being unrelated to the 
vaccination despite no relevant medical history pertaining to the severe adverse 
events in question. 
 
Louisiana governor reverses COVID vaccine mandate for students. 
 
Louisiana Democratic Governor John Bel Edwards on Wednesday reversed 
the state’s mandate requiring students in daycare through college to be fully 
vaccinated against COVID-19. 
 
The announcement reversed an earlier decision by the governor’s administration 
and the Louisiana Health Department (LHD) requiring students to be fully 
vaccinated beginning in the 2022-23 school year. 
 
Edwards said he based the decision on the fact that the FDA has not fully 
approved the vaccines for people under age 16, and his administration will 
continue to recommend all children age 5 and over get the vaccine — a 
recommendation the LHD endorsed Wednesday in a news release. 
 
In their statements, the governor and the LHD implied COVID-19 vaccines for 
people over age 16 are fully approved. 
 
However, while the FDA did grant full licensing to Pfizer’s Comirnaty 
and Moderna’s Spikevax COVID-19 vaccines — for people 16 and older and 18 
and older, respectively — those vaccines are not available in the U.S. 
 
All COVID-19 vaccines being administered in the U.S. are still available only under 
EUA. 
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World governments have launched a silent war upon their 
own people, using quiet weapons, lies and propaganda.  The 
mainstream media is enabling this deception and genocide.  
Our mission in this war it to bring you the truth. 
 

Because I am not a scientist, I AM NOT CONSIDERED  CREDITABLE 
to  prove my contention that Covid-19 was genetically engineered 
through the use of CRISPR-Cas9 “gene” engineering methods.  I have 
done my homework and diligence on this premise.  Even the article 
below that I have retained the past three or four segments provides 
circumstantial evidence (if not causal) that the spike protein as a 
vector was manipulated in an infinite number of ways to confuse the 
medical and scientific community.   
 
It was Pfizer’s CEO, Albert Borla who said that “We cracked the Code 
of Life”.  He called his vaxx a “Delivery System” which in itself infers 
that it was delivering more than a vaccine.  Dozens of articles shared 
in this series have confirmed human manipulation of what people 
were injected with is not therapeutic but toxic and potentially fatal!  It 
is the use of CRISPR-Cas9 “gene” editing that can be used for good 
but can also be used for evil nefarious applications!  

 

The Many Ways The Spike Protein 
Annihilates Human Life 

 

 
'The Spike Protein Is What The 'Vaccine' Is Supposed To Make In Your Body...The 
Spike Protein Is One Of The Most Contrived Toxins or Poisons That Man Has Ever 
Made...And The Aim Of This Toxin Is To KILL Billions Without Anyone Noticing It.'  - Dr. 
Shankara Chetty  
 
The diabolical pathways the spike protein uses to destroy the human body are many.  
As Dr. Chetty makes clear, there has never been anything more deadly in human 
history than the spike protein.  Below are just some of the methods its creators built into 
it to make 100% certain billions will die.  The techniques the spike protein uses are often 
referred to as 'cascades'.  Whatever term you use, from avalanche to tsunami, once the 
spike protein has entered your body it is just a matter of time for it to do its demonic 
work...  
 
AIDS - Total Immunological Collapse And Failure  
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...This includes widespread auto-immune diseases  
 
Explosion Of Cancer In The Body   
...Cancers of all types, including reactivated and  
brand new cancers...even cancers never seen before    
 
Sterilization   
...Destruction of male and female reproductive organs  and system  
 
Clotting And Hemorrhaging  
...Clotting from the spike protein is abnormal and resistant to degradation  
 
Systemic Fibrosis   
...Extensive scarring throughout the entire body  
 
Neuro Degenerative Diseases   
...Prions (CJD), Amyloid Deposits (Alzheimers, Parkinsons, ALS, etc.)  
 
Cytokine Storm And ADE (Antibody Dependent Enhancement)   
...Hypersensitivity to the Spike Protein 
 
The creators of this “Gene Therapy” are likely to have known the harm the “Spike 
Protein” would do over time.  With more than two years to document the results of the 
Vaxx since administering the first shots in December of 2020, the VAERS reporting 
system has documented 1.2+ million adverse reactions among the population. 
   
In the late summer of 2020, Dr. Sherri Tenpenny and Dr. Carrie Madej were calling out 
those pushing the new “Gene Therapy”.  It was known that from early animal test 
studies the animals all died from this experimental treatment and the animal studies 
were abruptly canceled.  The accumulating evidence to date leaves one to conclude 
that his experiment was criminal and that responsible need to be indicted and 
prosecuted for criminal negligence, manslaughter, and pre-meditated murder.   
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Our Government wants you DEAD! 
This includes the CDC, NIH, NIAID, 

and the World Health Organization!! 
The “Depopulation” agenda began 
Shortly after the 1968 publication of  

“The Population Bomb”  
by Dr. Paul Ehrlich and his wife Anne. 
“Depopulation has been the World’s #1 Issue since 1968!”  It 
underlies every global issue since.  Whether it is climate 
change or the Global Reset, “depopulation” is at the core of 
everything!!  It’s all about Sustainable Development!  
 

Anyone who is a skeptic of my statement should 
Google search the term “Georgia Guidestones” 
and read their goal engraved in granite stone 
back in 1980.  The stone structure calls for the 
eradication of 93% of the world’s population. 
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Blessings, 
 
 
Pastor Bob, EvanTeachr@aol.com 
www.pastorbobreid.com  
http://jesusisthewaythetruththelife.com/node/22  
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